








APPENDIX H

SECTION H108
ANIMATED DEVICES

H108.1 Fail-safe device. Signs that contain moving sections
or ornaments shall have fail-safe provisions to prevent the
section or ornament from releasing and falling or shifting its
center of gravity more than 15 inches (381 mm). The fail-safe
device shall be in addition to the mechanism and the mecha­
nism's housing which operate the movable section or orna­
ment. The fail-safe device shall be capable of supporting the
full dead weight of the section or ornament when the, moving
mechanism releases.

SECTION H109
GROUND SIGNS

H109.1 Height restrictions. The structural frame of ground
signs shall not be erected of combustible materials to a height
of more than 35 feet (10668 mm) above the ground. Ground
signs constructed entirely of noncombustible material shall
not be erected to a height of greater than 100 feet (30 480
mm) above the ground. Greater heights are permitted where
approved and located so as not to create a hazard or danger
to the public.

8109.2 Required clearance. The bottom coping of every
ground sign shall be not less than 3 feet (914 mm) above the
ground or street level, which space can be filled with plat­
form decorative trim or light wooden construction.

H109.3 Wood anchors and supports. Where wood anchors
or supports are embedded in the soil, the wood shall be pres­
sure treated with an approved preservative.

SECTION H11a
ROOF SIGNS

8110.1 General. Roof signs shall be constructed entirely of
metal or other approved noncombustible material except as
provided for in Sections HI06.1.1 and HI07.1. Provisions
shall be made for electric grounding of metallic parts. Where
combustible materials are permitted in letters or other orna­
mental features, wiring and tubing shall be kept free and
insulated therefrom. Roof signs shall be so constructed as to
leave a clear space of not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) between
the roof level and the lowest part of the sign and shall have
at least 5 feet (1524 mm) clearance between the vertical sup­
ports thereof. No portion of any roof sign structure shall pro­
ject beyond an exterior wall.

Exception: Signs on flat roofs with every part of the roof
accessible.

H110.2 Bearing plates. The bearing plates of roof signs shall
distribute the load directly to or upon masonry walls, steel

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

H108 - H112.1

roof girders, columns or beams. The building shall be
designed to avoid over stress of these members.

H110.3 Height of solid signs. A roof sign having a solid sur­
face shall not exceed, at any point, a height of 24 feet (7315
mm) measured from the roof surface.

H110.4 Height of open signs. Open roof signs in which the
uniform open area is not less than 40% of total gross area
shall not exceed a height of 75 feet (22860 mm) on buildings
of Type 1 or Type 2 construction. On buildings of other con­
struction types, the height shall not exceed 40 feet (12 192
mm). Such signs shall be thoroughly secured to the building
upon which they are installed, erected or constructed by iron,
metal anchors, bolts, supports, chains, stranded cables, steel
rods or braces and they shall be maintained in good condi­
tion.

H110.5 Height of closed signs. A closed roof sign shall not
be erected to a height greater than 50 feet (15240 mm) above
the roof of buildings of Types 1 and 2 construction, nor more
than 35 feet (10 668 mm) above the roof of buildings of
Types 3,4 and 5 construction.

SECTION H111
WALL SIGNS

H111.1 Materials. Wall signs which have an area exceeding
40 square feet (3.72 m2) shall be constructed of metal or
other approved noncombustible material, except for nailing
rails and as provided for in Sections HI06.1.1 and HI07.1.

H111.2 Exterior wall mounting details. Wall signs attached
to exterior walls of solid masonry, concrete or stone, shall be
safely and securely attached by means of metal anchors, bolts
or expansion screws of not less than 3/s-inch (9.5 mm) diam­
eter and shall be embedded at least 5 inches (127 mm). Wood
blocks shall not be used for anchorage, except in the case of
wall signs attached to buildings with walls of wood. A wall
sign shall not be supported by anchorages secured to an
unbraced parapet wall.

H111.3 Extension. Wall signs shall not extend above the top
of the wall, nor extend beyond the ends of the wall to which
the signs are .attached unless such signs conform to the
requirements for roof signs, projecting signs or ground signs.

SECTION H112
PROJECTING SIGNS

Hl12.1 General. Projecting signs shall be constructed entire­
ly of metal or other noncombustible material and securely
attached to a building or structure by metal supports such as
bolts, anchors, supports, chains, guys or steel rods. Staples or
nails shall not be used to secure any projecting sign to any

725



H112.2 - "fABLE 4-A

building or structure. The dead load of projecting signs not
parallel to the building or structure and the load due to wind
pressure shall be supported with chains, guys or steel rods
having net cross-sectional dimension of not less than 3/s-inch
(9.5 mm) diameter. Such supports shall be erected or main­
tained at an angle of at least 45 percent (0.78 rad) with the
horizontal to resist the dead load and at angle of 45 percent
(0.78 rad) or more with the face of the sign to resist the spec­
ified wind pressure. If such projecting sign exceeds 30 square
feet (2.8 m2) in one facial area, there shall be provided at
least two such supports on each side not more than 8 feet
(2438 mm) apart to resist the wind pressure.

HJ1J2.2 Attachment of supports. Supports shall be secured
to a bolt or expansion screw that will develop the strength of
the supporting chains, guys or steel rods, with a minimum
sis-inch (15.9 mm) bolt or lag screw, by an expansion shield.
Turn buckles shall be placed in chains, guys or steel rods sup­
porting projecting signs.

H112.3 Walll mounting details. Chains, cables, guys or steel
rods used to support the live or dead load of projecting signs
are permitted to be fastened to solid masonry walls with
expansion bolts or by machine screws in iron supports, but
such supports shall not be attached to an unbraced parapet
wall. Where the supports must be fastened to walls made of
wood, the supporting anchor bolts must go through the wall
and be plated or fastened on the inside in a secure manner.

Hl12.4 lBIenght Iimntatiolll. A projecting sign shall not be
erected on the wall of any building so as to project above the
roof or cornice wall or above the roof level where there is no
cornice wall; except that a sign erected at a right angle to the
building, the horizontal width of which sign is perpendicular
to such a wall and does not exceed 18 inches (457 mm), is
permitted to be erected to a height not exceeding 2 feet (610
mm) above the roof or cornice wall or above the roof level
where there is no cornice wall. A sign attached to a corner of
a building and parallel to the vertical line of such corner shall
be deemed to be erected at a right angle to the building wall.

H112.5 AdditionaR Roads. Projecting sign structures which
will be used to support an individual on a ladder or other ser­
vicing device, whether or not specifically designed for the
servicing device, shall be capable of supporting the antici­
pated additional load, but not less than a IOO-pound (445 N)
concentrated horizontal load and a 300-pound (1334 N) con­
centrated vertical load applied at the point of assumed or
most eccentric loading. The building component to which the
projecting sign is attached shall also be designed to support
the additional loads.

726

APPENDIX H

SECTION H113
MARQUEE SIGNS

H113.1 MaterJials. Marquee signs shall be constructed
entirely of metal or other approved noncombustible material
except as provided for in Sections HI06.l.1 and HI07.l.

H113.2 Attachment. Marquee signs shall be attached to
approved marquees that are constructed in accordance with
Section 3106.

Hl13.3 Dimensions. Marquee signs, whether on the front or
side, shall not project beyond the perimeter of the marquee.

H113.4 Height IimitatioJIl. Marquee signs shall not extend
more than 6 feet (1829 mm) above, nor 1 foot (305 mm)
below such marquee, but under no circumstances shall the
sign or signs have a vertical dimension greater than 8 feet
(2438 mm).

SECTION H114
PORTABLE SIGNS

Hl14.1 General. Portable signs shall conform to require­
ments for ground, roof, projecting, flat and. temporary signs
where such signs are used in a similar capacity. The require­
ments of this section shall not be construed to require
portable signs to have connections to surfaces, tie-downs or
foundations where provisions are made by temporary means
or configuration of the structure to provide stability for the
expected duration of the installation.

TABLE 4-A
SIZE, THICKNESS AND TYPE OF GLASS PANELS IN SIGNS

MAXIMUM SIZE OF
EXPOSED PANEL

MINIMUM
Any Area THICKNESS

dimension (square OF GLASS
(inches) inches) (inches) TYPE OF GLASS

30 500 1/8 Plain, plate or wired

45 700 31t6 Plain, plate or wired

144 3,600 1/4 Plain, plate or wired

>144 >3,600 1/4 Wired glass

For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm, 1 square inch =645 mm2

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODe®

•

•



APPENDIX H

TABLE 4-B
THICKNESS OF PROJECTION SIGN

PROJECTION MAXIMUM THICKNESS
(feet) (feet)

5 2
4 2.5
3 3
2 3.5
1 4

For SI: 1 foot =304.8 mm.

SECTION H115
REFERENCED STANDARDS

TABLE 4-B - H115

ASTM D 635-97 Test for Rate of Burning
and/or Extent and Time of
Burning of Self-Supporting
Plastics in a Horizontal
Position.

HI07.1.1

ICC EC-2000

NFPA 701-96

ICC Electrical Code

Methods of Fire Test for
Flame Resistant Textiles
and Films.

H106.1,
H106.2

H106.1.1

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 727



728 2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODIE®



APPENDIX I

PATIO COVERS
The provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory unless specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance.

SECTION 1101
GENERAL

nOI.l General. Patio covers shall be permitted to be
detached from or attached to dwelling units. Patio covers
shall be used only for recreational, outdoor living purposes
and not as carports, garages, storage rooms or habitable
rooms. Openings shall be permitted to be enclosed with
insect screening, approved translucent or transparent plastic
not more that 0.125 inch (3.2 mm) in thickness, glass con­
forming to the provisions of Chapter 24 or any combination
of the foregoing.

SECTION 1102
DEFINITIONS

1102.1 General. The following word and term shall, for the
purposes of this appendix have the meaning shown herein.

PATIO COVERS. One story structures not exceeding 12
feet (3657 mm) in height. Enclosure walls shall be permitted
to be of any configuration, provided the open or glazed area
of the longer wall and one additional wall is equal to at least
65 percent of the area below a minimum of 6 feet 8 inches
(2032 mm) of each wall, measured from the floor.

SECTION 1103
EXTERIOR OPENINGS

1103.1 Light, ventilation and emergency egress. Exterior
openings required for light and ventilation shall be permitted
to open into a patio structure. However, the patio structure
shall be unenclosed if such openings are serving as emer­
gency egress or rescue openings from sleeping rooms.
Where such exterior openings serve as an exit from the
dwelling unit, the patio structure, unless unenclosed, shall be
provided with exits conforming to the provision of Chapter
10.

SECTION 1104
STRUCTURAL PROVISIONS

n04.1 Design loads. Patio covers shall be designed and con­
structed to sustain, within the stress limits of this code, all
dead loads plus a minimum vertical live load of 1,0 pounds
per square foot (0.48 kN/m2) except that snow loads shall be
used where such snow loads exceed this minimum. Such
patio covers shall be designed to resist the minimum wind
and seismic loads set forth in this code.

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

1104.2 Footings. In areas with a frost depth of zero, a patio
cover shall be permitted to be supported on a concrete slab on
grade without footings, provided the slab conforms to the
provisions of Chapter 19 of this code, is not less than 31h
inches (89 mm) thick and further provided that the columns
do not support loads in excess of 750 pounds (3.36 kN) per
column.

729



730 2000 ~NTeRNATIONAL BUILDING cOlOe®



APPENDIX J

SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS FOR
QUALIFIED HISTORIC BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES

The provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory unless specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance.

SECTION J101
ACCESSIBILITY PROVISIONS

JI01.1 Qual~fied historic buildings and faciliti~s. These
procedures shall apply to buildings and facilities designated
as historic structures that undergo alterations or a change of
occupancy.

purposes of this section to a local government historic
preservation program that has been certified in accordance
with Section 101 of the National Historic Preservation Act
of 1966 [(16 U.S.C. 470a(c)] and implementing regula­
tions (36 CFR 61.5), the responsibility shall be permitted
to be carried out by the appropriate local government body
or official.

JI01.4 Displays. In qualified historic buildings and facili­
ties, where alternative requirements of Section 3408 are per­
mitted, displays and written information shall be located
where they can be seen by a seated person. Exhibits and
signs displayed horizontally shall be 44 inches (1120 mm)
maximum above the floor.

JI01.2 Qualified historic buildings and facilities subject
to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act.
Where an alteration or change of occupancy are undertaken
to a qualified historic building or facility that is subject to
Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act, the
federal agency with jurisdiction over the undertaking shall
follow the Section 106 process. Where the State Historic
Preservation Officer or Advisory Council on· Historic
Preservation determines that compliance with the require­
ments for accessible routes, ramps, entrances, or toilet facili­
ties would threaten or destroy the historic significance of the
building or facility, the alternative requirements of Section
3408 for that element is permitted.

JI01.3 Qualified historic buildings and facilities not sub­
ject to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation
Act. Where an alteration or change of occupancy are under­
taken to a qualified historic building or facility that is not
subject to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation
Act, and the entity undertaking the alterations believe that
compliance with the requirements for accessible routes,
ramps, entrances, or toilet facilities would threaten or destroy
the historic significance of the building or facility, the entity
shall consult with the State Historic Preservation Officer.
Where the State Historic Preservation Officer determines
that compliance with the accessibility requirements for
accessible routes, ramps, entrances or toilet facilities would
threaten or destroy the historical significance of the building
or facility, the alternative requirements of Section 3408 for
that element is permitted.

JI01.3.1 Consultation with interested persons.
Interested persons shall be invited to participate in the
consultation process, including state or local accessibility
officials, individuals with disabilities, and organizations
representing individuals with disabilities.

JI01.3.2 €ertified local government historic preserva­
tion programs. Where the State Historic Preservation
Officer has delegated the consultation responsibility for

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Y3.H6262P
43/933

SECTION J102
REFERENCED STANDARDS

National Historic Preservation
Act of 1966, as amended
3rd Edition, Washington, DC:
US Government Printing
Office, 1993

1101.2,
1101.3,

1101.3.2

731



732 2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING COOe®

•



INDEX

A
ACCESS OPENINGS

Attic 1208.2
Crawl space . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ..1208.1
Doors 710.3.1.1
Fire damper 715.4
Fire department .402.15
Mechanical appliances - 1208.3
Refuse/laundry chutes 707.13.3

ACCESSIBILITY Chapter 11
Airports E111 0
Bus stops and terminals E11 08
Customer service facility 1108.12
Detectable warnings 1108.9
Dining areas 1107.2.5, 3408.7.5
Dressing, fitting and locker rooms 3408.7.10
Dwelling units 1107.5.4
Egress 1003.2.13
Elevators 1108.6, Chapter 30, 3408.7.1
Entrances 1105, 3408.8.3
Escalators E11 09.2.9
Existing buildings 1103.2.2, 3408,

A1108.4, E1109.4
Historic buildings 3408.8
Hotel guest rooms 1107.5,3408.7.8
Lifts 1108.7
Parking and passenger loading

facilities 1106
Performance areas 3408.7.6
Platform, raised E11 03.1
Ramps 1003.3.4.12, Chapter 11

3408.7.4, 3408.8.5
Route 1104, 1107.5.5, E11 09.3.1
Sales and service counters 3408.7.13
Scoping E11
Signage 1109, E11 07
Sleeping accommodations 1107.5.1
Telephone E11 06
Toilet and bathing facilities 1108.2,

3408.7.9, 3408.8.4, E11 05.2
Treads and risers 1003.3.3.3
Wheelchair spaces 1107.2.2

ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS 1003.2.13
ADMINISTRATION Chapter 1
ADOBE CONSTRUCTION 2102.1, 2109.8
AFFIDAVITS 1807.2.20
AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS (GROUP U) ...312.1,

1103.2.5, Appendix C
AIR CONDITIONING
(see MECH~NICAL) .101.4.3, 1606.2, 2801.1,3006.2
AIR INTAKES (YARDS OR COURTS) .....1205.3.2

2000 iNTERNATIONAL BUilDING CODE®

AIRCRAFT HANGARS .412.2
Aircraft paint hangars .412.4, 507.6
Basements .412.2.2
Construction exterior walls .412.2.1
Heliports and helistops .412.5
Residential .412.3
Unlimited height 504.1

AIRCRAFT RELATED
OCCUPANCIES .412, 907.2.22

Airport traffic control towers .412.1
Egress .412.1.3
Fire detection systems, automatic .412.1.4,

907.2.22
Standby power .412.1.5, 2702.2.17
Type of construction .412.1.2

AISLE
Assembly seating 1008.7
Check-out 1108.12.2, 3407.7.11
Converging 1008.7.3
Grandstands, reviewing stands

and bleachers 1008.5, 1108.8
Obstructions 1008.7.6
Stairs, handrails 1008.11
Tents 3103.4
Width .. '" 1008.7.2,1008.7.4,1008.8

ALARM SYSTEMS, EMERGENCY 908
ALARMS, DOOR 1103.3.1.8.2(5)
ALARMS, FIRE (see FIRE ALARM)
ALARMS, VISIBLE 907.9.1
ALARMS, VOICE

High-rise buildings 907.2.12.2
ALTERATIONS

Accessibility 3408
Applicability of code 101.2
Building 3402

ALTERNATE MATERIALS, DESIGN, AND
METHODS 104.11

ALTERNATING TREAD STAIRWAYS 1003.3.3.10
Construction 1003.3.3.10.2
Galleries, catwalks, and gridirons 1007.5.1

ALUMINUM 1404.5.1, 1604.3.5, Chapter 20
AMUSEMENT BUILDING, SPECIAL .411

Emergency voice/alarm communications
system .411.6

Exit marking .411.7
Fire detection, automatic .411.3
Interior finish .411.8
Smoke detection system 907.2.11
Sprinklers, automatic 411.4

AMUSEMENT PARK BUILDING 303

733



INDEX

ANCHOR SrORE
(see COVERED MAll BUILDINGS) .402.2

Construction type .402.6
Means of egress .402.4.3.1
Occupant load .402.4.1.3

ANCHORAGE 1604.8
Concrete, seismic 1604.8.2
Masonry 1604.8.2
Wind Load 1609.1.3

A~ARrMENT HOUSlES 310.1
APPIEAlS 112
ARCHrineCr (see REGISTERED DESIGN

P~OFESSIONAl)

ARCHmlECrURAl TRIM 1406.2.2
AREA, I8UlllDlNG Chapter 5

Basements 503.1.1
Enclosed parking garage 508.2, 508.3
Limitations 503,505
Membrane structures 3102
Mezzanines 505.2
Mixed construction types 3102.6
Mixed occupancy 302.3
Modifications 506
Open parking garage 508.3,508.8
Residential aircraft hangars .412.3.6, 504.1
Unlimited 503.1.4, 506.2.1, 507

A~EA BlDllDINGS, UNLIMITED 507
AREA Of REFUGE 1003.2.13.5
ASSEMBLY OCCUPANCY (GROUP A) 303,1008

Access, single 1008.8.2
Accessory Table 302.3.3(d)
Aisles 1008.7
Bleachers (see BLEACHERS)
Egress, special provisions 1008.1
Fire alarms 907.2.1
Grandstands (see GRANDSTANDS)
Interior finishes Table 803.4
Motion picture theatres 507.8
Occupancy Separation Table 302.2.2(f, d, e)
Panic Hardware 1003.3.1
Reviewing stands (see REVIEWING SrANDS)
Seating, smoke-protected 1008.8.1, 1008.5.2
Sprinklers 507.2, 903.2.1
Standby power systems 2702.2.1
Standpipes 905.3.3

ATRIUM 404
Automatic sprinkler protection .404.3
Automatic fire detection .404.6
Enclosure .404.5
Interior finish .404.8
Smoke control .404.4, 707.2, 909, 907.2.13
Standby power .404.7
Use 404.2

ATIAC~ED GARAGE 302.1.1, 406.2.9

734

ATTIC
Access 1208.2
Combustible storage .413.2
Draftstopping 716.4
Insulation 718.3.1
Live load Table 1607.1
Unusable Space fire protection 710.3.2
Ventilation 1202.2,

AUDITORIUM
Accessibility 1107.2
Foyers and lobbies 1008.3
Interior balconies and galleries 1008.4
Motion picture projection rooms .409
Stages and platforms .410

AUTOMOBILE PARKING GARAGIE (see GARAGE,
AUTOMOBilE PARKING) .406

AUTOMOBILE, REPAIR GARAGE
(see Garage, Repair) .406.6
Gas-detection system .406.6.6, 908.5
Floor surface .406.6.4
Ventilation .406.6.3

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE STATION .406.5
AWNINGS

Design and construction 3105.2
Drainage, water 3201.4
Live load 1607.11.2.4
Plastic 2606.10
Public Right-of-way 3202.2.3, 3202.3.1
encroachments

Definition 202.1

B
BALCONIES 1004.3.4

Accessibility 1107.5.2
Construction requirements 1406.3
Egress doors, residential
Egress, means of 704.2,1003.3,

1006.2.2, 1008.4
. Emergency Escape 1009.1
Encroachments 3202.3.2
Exterior 1004.3.4
Guards 1003.2.12, 1008.1.2
Interior "1008.4
Live load Table 1607.1
Projection, combustible 1406.3
Seat stability 1008.10
Seismic 2308.12.7
Travel distance 1004.2.4.2

BARBECUES 2801
BASEMENT (see UNDERGROUND BUILDINGS)

Aircraft hangars .412.2.2
Area modification 503.1.1, 506.1
Considered a story 502.1
Emergencyescape 1009.1
Height modifications for 508.2, 508.3, 508.6

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING COOE®



Prohibited .415.4, 415.5,
415.7.3.5,415.9.5.2.2,418.1

Rodent proofing Appendix F
Sprinklers 903..2.12.1
Waterproofing and dampproofing 1806

BASEMENT WALLS
Concrete Table 1904.2.2(2),

1909.6.1, 1910.4.4.1
Loads 1805.5
Waterproofing ~ 1806.1.1

BAY AND ORIEL WINDOWS 1406.4
BLEACHERS

Accessibility 1107.2
Egress 1008.5
Footboards 1008.13

BLOCK (see CONCRETE BLOCK, GLASS BLOCK)
BOARD OF APPEALS 112, Appendix 8

Application for appeal 8101.1
Alternate members 8101.2.1
80ard decision 8101.4
Limitations on authority 112.2
Membership of board 8101.2
Notice of meeting 8101.3
Qualifications 112.3, 8101.2.2

BOILER
Exits 1007.1
Fire detection 907.2

BOLTS
. Anchors 1912, 1913, 2103.11.5, 2108

High strength, steel 1704.3.3
BONDING, MASONRY ..2103.8,2109.6,2109.7.2.1
BRICK (see MASONRY)

Calculated fire resistance 720.4
Foundations 1805.5
Veneer 1405.5, 1405.9

BUILDING
Access, fire department .402.13, 402.15,

415.9.5.2.2, 909.21.2
Alterations 3402
Area (see AREA, BUILDING) Chapter 5
Demolition 3303
Existing Chapter 34
Height (see HEIGHT, BUILDING) Chapter 5
Occupancy classification Chapter 3

BUILDING DEPARTMENT 103
BUILDING OFFICIAL

Duties and powers 104
Qualifications A101.1
Records " 104.7
Termination A101 .4

BUILl-UP ROOFS 1507.10
BUSINESS OCCUPANCY (GROUP B) 304

Area modifications Table 503,506
Corridors (see CORRIDORS) 1004.3.6
Educational above 12th grade 304.1

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODe®

INDEX

Elevator lobby 1004.3:3.6(2)
Fire alarm 907.2.2
Parking under 508.2,508.8
Unlimited height 508.4
Single exit Table1005.2.2·
Special provisions 508

C
CABLES, STEEL STRUCTURAL .. ; 2207
CALCULATED FIRE RESISTANCE

(see FIRE RESISTANCE, CALCULATED)
CANOPIES 3105

Motor vehicle service stations .406.5.2
Fire district 0102.2.8
Live load, uniform 1607.11.2.4
Materials 3105.3
Permanent 0102.2.8

CARPET
Floor covering 804.2
Walls and ceilings 803.5.2

CEILING
Height .409.2, 909.20.4.3,

1204.2.2, 1207.2
Interior finish 803
Penetration of fire resistant assemblies 707,

711.4, 715.2, 715.6
Suspended acoustical 803.8.1.1

CERAMIC TILE
Material requirements 2103.4
Mortar 2103.9

CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY 110
CHILD CARE 305.2, 308.3.1, 308.5.2, 407.1
CHIMNEYS 2111

Factory-built 716.2.5, 2801
CHURCHES

Classification 303
Egress 1008
Fire alarm 907.2.1
Interior finishes Table 803.4
Locks and latches 1003.3.1.8
Stair enclosure 1005.3.2, 1008.4.1

CIRCULAR STAIRS 1003.3.3.7
CLAY ROOF TILE 1507.3
COAL POCKETS " .415.7.1.6
COLD STORAGE, INSULATION 2603.3, 2603.5
COMBUSTIBLE DUSTS .415.7.1
COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS .415.7.2
COMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL

High-pile stock or rack storage . .413.1. 910.2.3
In concealed spaces .413.2, 716.5
In Type I and Type II 603,804.;4
On exterior side of exterior wall 1406

COMBUSTIBLE PROJECTIONS 704.2,1406.3
COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE .413, 910.2.3

735



~NDIE){

COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL ....1004.2.5
COMPARl'MENTATION

Underground buildings .405.4
Values 3409.6.3

COMPUANCE ALTERNATIVES 3409
COMPRESSED GAS 307.2, 415.9.7.2.2, 903.3.2
CONCEALED SPACES .413.2, 716
CONCRIETE Chapter 19

Anchorage 1604.8.2, 1913
Calculated fire resistance 720.2
Conduits embedded in 1906.3
Construction documents 1901.4
Construction joints 1906
Curing 1905.11
Durability 1904
Exposure conditions 1904
Footings 1805.4
Formwork 1906
Foundation walls 1805.5
Inspections 1704.4, Table 1704.4
Materials 1707.4.1
Mixing 1905
Pipe columns, concrete-filled 1916
Pipes embedded in 1906
Placing 1905
Plain, structural 1909
Proportioning 1905.2
Quality 1905
Reinforced gypsum concrete 1915
Reinforcement 1907
Rodent proofing Appendix F
Roof tile 1508.3
Seismic provisions 1910
Shotcrete 1914
Slab, minimum 1911
Specifications 1903
Storage of materials 1903.7
Strength Testing 1704.4.1, 1905.6
Wood support 2304.12

CONCRETE MASONRY
Calculated fire resistance 720.3
Construction 2104
Design 2101.2
Surface bonding 2109.2.3
Testing 1714, 2105.2.2.1.2
Wood support 2104.1.6, 2304.12

CONCRETE ROOf T~lE 1507.3
Wind resistance 1609.7.3

CONDUn, PENETRAT~ONPROTECTION 711.3
711.4, 1005.3.4.1

CONFucrs IN COOlE 102.1
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS 106, 1603

Fire alarm and detection systems 907.1.1
Fire resistant joint systems 712
Floor live load 1603.1.1

736

Live loads posted 1603.3
Masonry 2101.3
Means of egress 106.1.2
Penetrations 711
Permit application 105.1
Retention 106.5
Review 106.3
Roof assemblies 1503
Roof live load 1603.1.2
Roof snow load 1603.1.3
Seismic 1603.1.5
Site plan 106.2
Soil classification and design

load bearing capacity 1802.6
Special loads 1603.1.6
Wind load " .1603.1.4

CONSTRUCTION JOINTS
Concrete , , ..1906.4
Shotcrete 1914.7

CONSTRUCTION, PUBLIC Chapter 32
PROPERTY

CONSTRUCTION TYPES Chapter 6
Automobile parking garage Table 406.3.1,

508.2 - 508.8
Classification 602
Combustible material in Type I and
Type II construction 603

Covered mall buildings .402.6
Fire resistance Table 601, Table 602
Highrise .403.3.3.1
Underground buildings .405.2

CONTRACTOR'S 901.5, 1705.3
RESPONSIBIUTIES

CONTROL AREA 414.2
CORNICES

Masonry 2104.2.1
Projection 704.2, 1406.3
Draftstopping 716.2.6

CORRIDOR 1004.3.3
Dead end (See Dead End)
Headroom 1003.2.5.1
HPM service 903.2.4.2
Open ended 1003.3.6
Ramps 1003.2.7
Walls 708.1
Width 1003.2.3.1, 1003.3.3.3

CORRIDOR PROTECTION, EXIT ACCESS
Construction, fire protection 708.1,

Table 1004.3.2.1
Doors 714.2.3
Interior finish Table 803.4, 804.4
Opening protectives Table 714.2
Return and exhaust air 715.5.4

CORROSIVES " .414.3
COURTS .704.3, 1205

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



COVERED MALL BUILDINGS .402
Emergency voice/alarm system 907.2.21
Standby power 2702.2.13
Standpipe system 905.3.4

COVERED WALKWAY 3306.7
CONVEYING SYSTEMS 3005
CRAWL SPACE

Access 1208.2
Drainage 1806.1.2
Ventilation 1202.3

CRYOGENIC FLUIDS Table 307.7,
Table 414.5.1, Table 415.9

D
DAMPERS (see FIRE DAMPERS, SMOKE

DAMPERS) 715.2 - 715.5
DAMPPROOFING AND WATERPROOFING ...1806

Required 1806.2, 1806.3
Subsoil drainage system 1806.4

DAY CARE 305.2, 308.5
DEAD END 1004.3.2.3

Aisle 1008.7.5
DEAD LOAD 1606

Building materials 1606.1
Definition 1602.1
Footing design load 1805.4.1.1
Load combinations 1605

DEFLECTION, STRUCTURAL '" .1604.3, 1620.1.5
DEMOLITION 3303
DIAPHRAGMS

Definition 1602.1, 1609.2
Irregularities, seismic Table 1616.5.1
Masonry construction 2109.2.1.3
Particleboard 2306.4.3
Seismic design 1620.1.5, 1620.3.3
Steel deck 2205
Vertical gypsum board 2504, Table 2306.4.5
Wood 2302.1, 2305, 2305.2, 2306.3
Wood structural panel 2303.1.4

DOORS 1003.3
Access-controlled 1003.3.1.3.4
Closers and Latches 714.2.7
Emergency egress 1009
Fire (see OPENING 714.2, 1005.3.5.2

PROTECTIVES)
Glass 714.2.6, 1405.12
Horizontal sliding 1003.3.1.3.3
In means of egress 1003.2.3
Landings 1003.3.1.5
Locks and Latches (see LOCKS) 1003.3.1.8
Panic and fire exit hardware 1008.3.1.9
Power operated 1003.3.1.3.2
Revolving 1003.3.1.3.1
Security grilles 1003.3.1.3.5
Side swinging 1003.3.1.2

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

Smoke barrier 709.5
Structural testing, exterior 1714.5
Thresholds 1003.3.1.6
To area of refuge 1003.2.13.5.5
Width 1003.3.1.1

DRAFTSTOPPING
Attic s716.4
Floor-ceiling assemblies 716.3

DRY CLEANING PLANTS .415.7.4
DRYING ROOMS .417
DUCTS AND AIR TRANSFER OPENINGS ..704.14,

706.9,715
DUMBWAITERS " 707.14

E
EARTHQUAKE LOADS (see 1613 - 1623

SEISMIC)
EAVES (see COMBUSTIBLE PROJECTIONS and

CORNICES)
Live Load, Uniform 1607.11.2.5

EDUCATIONAL OCCUPANCY (GROUP E) 305
Day care 305.2
Egress, .special provisions 1003.3.1.9
Fire alarm 907.2.3
Manual fire alarm boxes 907.3
Panic hardware 1003.3.19
Special occupancy separation Table 302.3.3
Sprinkler system 903.2.2

EGRESS (see MEANS OF EGRESS) Chapter 10
ELECTRICAL Chapter 27
ELEVATOR

Accessibility 1108.6
Car size 3002.4
Construction 707.14
Control values 3409.6.14
Conveying systems 3005
Emergency operations " .3002.3, 3002.5, 3003
High-rise .403.9
Hoistway enclosures 3002, 3005
Hoistway venting 3004
Lobby 707.14.1
Machine rooms 3006
Means of egress 1003.2.9,

1003.2.13.1, 1003.2.13.1.1, 1003.2.13.3
Number of elevator cars in hoistway '" .3002.2
Personnel and material hoists 3005.4
Seismic requirements 1621.3.14
Shaft enclosure 707.14
Signs 1003.2.13.6
Standby power 2702.2.5, 2702.2.18

EMERGENCY COMMUNICATIONS
Area of refuge 1003.2.13.5.3

EMERGENCY EGRESS OPENINGS
Window wells 1009.5

EMERGENCY LIGHTING 1003.2.11

737



~NDEX

/EMERGENCV IPOWElRl
Exit signs 2702.2.3
Group 1-3 .408.4.2, 2702.2.16
Hazardous .414.5.4, 415.9.10
High-rise, business and residential

occupancies .403.10,2702.2.14
Loads, underground buildings .405.10.1
Means of egress illumination 1003.2.11.2,

2702.2.4
Underground buildings .405.10

[EMPlOV!EE
Qualifications A101
Termination of employment A101.4

[ENCLOSED, WAU(WAV 3104
[ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE PUJeuc
IRl~GH'f OF WAY Chapter 32

IEN~-JO~NTED LUMBER! 2303.1.1
/ENERGV EFF~C~ENCV Chapter 13
/ENG~NElER (see REGISTERED

[))ESIGN PROFESSIONAL)
lEQlWVALIENT OPENING FACTOR Figure 704.7
/ESCALATORS AND MOVING WAllKS 3005

Floor opening protection 707.2
Illumination 2702.2.4
Prohibited as means of egress 1003.2.9

[EXCAVAT~ON, GRADING AND FilL 1803
lEX~STING BUilDING

Accessibility 1103.2.2, 3407
Additions, alterations, or repairs 3402
Change of occupancy 3405
Escalator 3408.7.3
Flood resistant Appendix G
Historic 3406
Moved structures 3407
Occupancy change 110.2
Rodent-proofing Appendix F

/EXIT (see MEANS OF EGRESS)
Aisles 1004.3.2
Aisles with tables 1004.3.1
Boiler rooms 1007.1
Construction 706.1
Corridors 1004.3.3
Courts 1006.3.1
Discharge 1006
Enclosure, vertical exit 1005.3.2
Fire resistance 706.3. 1005.3.2
Furnace rooms 1007.1
Horizontal 1005.3.5
Illumination 1003.2.11
Incinerator rooms 1007.1
Interior finish Table 803.4
Mezzanines 505.3, 1004.2.1
Number, minimum 1004.2,1005.2.1
Passageway 1005.3.3
Path, common 1004.2.5

738

Refrigerated rooms or spaces 1007.3
Refrigeration machinery rooms 1007.2
Signs (see Exit signs)
Travel distance 1004.2.4
Underground buildings .405.8

EXIT ACCESS (see MEANS 1003,1004
OF EGRESS)

EXIT DISCHARGE (see MEANS 1006
OF EGRESS)

EXIT PASSAGEWAY
(see MEANS OF EGRESS) 1005.3.3

EXIT SIGNS 1003.2.10
Area of refuge 1003.2.13.6
Special amusement buildings .411.7

EXPLOSIVES Table 414.5.1 , Table 415.3.2.2,
Table 415.9

EXTERIOR WAllS
(see WAllS, EXTERIOR) 704, Chapter 14

IF
FACTORY OCCUPANCY (GROUP F) 306

Increase dead end distance 1004.3.3.4(2)
Low hazard occupancy 306.3
Moderate hazard occupancy 306.2
Smoke and heat vents 910.2
Travel distance increase 1004.2.4.1

FARM BUILDINGS Appendix C
FASTENING, WOOD CONSTRUCTION 2304.9
flEES, PERMIT 108

Application 105.1.
Plan review 106.3
Related fees 108.5
Work commencing before issuance 108.4
Refunds 108.6

FENCES 312.1
fiBERBOARD 2303.1.5
fiLL MATERIAL 1803.4
FINGER-JOINTED LUMBER

(see lEND-JOINTED LUMBER)
FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS

Aerosol storage 907.2.16
Assembly 907.2.1
Atriums 907.2.13
Audible alarm 907.9.2
Battery room 907.2.23
Construction documents 907.1.1
Covered mall 907.2.20
High-rise 907.2.12
Lumber storage 907.2.17
Occupancy requirements 907.2.1, 907.2.10
Special amusement buildings 907.2.11
Underground buildings .....907.2.18, 907.2.19,

907.2.20
Visible alarm 907.9.1

FIRE ALARM BOX, MANUAL 907.3

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUilDING CODE®



f~RE IBARRIERS 706
IF~RE COMMAND STATION .403.7, 403.8, 911
fiRE DAMPERS 715.2 - 715.5
f~RE DEPARTMENT ACCESS .402.15
fiRE DETECTION SYSTEM, AUTOMATIC

Airport traffic control towers .412.1.4
Atriums .404.6
High-rise buildings 403.5
Institutional occupancy .. .407.2.1,407.2.3,407.6
Special amusement bUildings .411.3

fiRE DISTRICT Appendix 0
fiRE DOOR

(see OPENING PROTECTIVES) .. 714, 1005.3.5.2,
fIRE EXTINGUISHERS, PORTABLE 906
fIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS,

NON-WATER BASED : ..904
fIRE PARTITION 602.4.6, 708, 715.5.3
IFIRE PROTECTION

Alarm, emergency systems 908
Alarm, audible 907.9.2
Alarms, visible 907.9.1
Explosion control .414.5;1, 911
Fire extinguishers, portable 906
Glazing, rated 714.3
Smoke control systems 909
Smoke and heat vents .415.6, 910
Sprinkler systems 903

fiRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS 901.2
IF~RE RESISTANCE

Calculated 720
Conditions of restraint 703.2.3
Ducts and air transfer openings 715
Joint systems 712
Prescriptive 719
Ratings Chapter 6, 703, 704.5, 706
Tests 703
Thermal and sound insulating materials ..718.1

fIRE RESISTANCE, CALCULATED 720
Clay brick and tile masonry 720.4
Concrete assemblies 720.2
Concrete masonry 720.3
Steel assemblies 720.5
Wood assemblies 720.6

fIRE RETARDANT TREATED WOOD
Awnings 3105.2
Balconies 1406.3
Canopies 3105.2
Concealed spaces 716.5
Fastening 2304.9.5
Fire wall vertical continuity 705.6
Partitions 603.1
Platforms .410.4
Roof construction Table 601, 705.6, 1505,
Shakes and shingles 1505.6.1
Veneer 1405.4

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE Table 602, 702
Exterior walls 1406.2.1.1

FIRE SHUTTER (see 714.2
OPENING PROTECTIVES)

FIRE WALLS 705
Combustible framing 705.7
Exterior intersecting walls 705.5.1
Fire resistance rating 705.4
Materials 705.3
Openings, protected 705.8

Structural stability 705.2
FIRE WINDOWS (see OPENING PROTECTIVES)
FIREBLOCKING 716.2

Chimneys 716.2.5, 2111.14, 2113.20
Wood construction ..716.2.1, 716.2.7, 1406.2.4
Wood stairs 716.2.4

FIREPLACES, FACTORY-BUILT 2111.16.1
FIREPLACES, MASONRY

Combustibles 2111.12, 2111.13
General provisions 2111
Hearth extension 2111.9, 2111.10
Steel units 2111.6

FIREWORKS 307.3
FLAMESPREAD 802, Table 803.4
FLAMMABLE FINISHES .416

Fire protection .416.4
FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS .415.7.2
FLAMMABLE SOUDS 307.5, 415.1
FLASHING 1503.2, 1507.3.9, 1507.5.6,

1507.7.6,1507.8.7,1507.9.8,1510.6
Roof 1503.2
Wall, veneer 1405.3, 1405.11.7

FLOOD RESISTANT
CONSTRUCTION 1403.6, 1612, Appendix G

FLOOR/CEILING (see FLOOR CONSTRUCTION)
FLOOR CONSTRUCTION

(see FLOOR CONSTRUCTION, WOOD)
Draftstopping 716.3
Fire resistance 706.3, 710
Live loads 1607.2, 1610
Materials Chapter 6
Penetration of fire resistant assemblies 710.5, 711

FLOOR CONSTRUCTION, WOOD
Beams and girders 2304.11 .2.4, 2308.7
Bridging/blocking ..2308.8.5, 2309.9.9, 2308.10.6
Glass 2409
Diaphragms 2305.2
Fastening schedule 2304.9.1
Framing 602.4.2, 2304.4
Joists 2308.8
Sheathing 2304.7

FLOOR COVERING 804.1, 804.2
FLOOR FINISH, INTERIOR 804
FLOOR LEVEL AT DOORS 1003.3.1.4

739



~I\!IDEX

flOOR lOADS
Certificate of occupancy 110.1
Combination 1605
Live 1607
Posting 1603.1.1
Soil pressures 1610

FLOOR OPENING PROTECTION
(see VIERT~CAlOPENING PROrECT~ON)

fOAM PLASTICS .402.14.5
Attics 718.3.1, 2603.4.1.6
Concealed 603
Cold storage 2603.4.1.2
Crawl space 2603.4.1.6
Density mall signs .402.14.5.1
Doors 2603.4.1.7
Exterior walls of multistory buildings 2603.5
Interior finish 801.2.2, 2603.7, 2604
Label/identification 2603.2
Roofing 2603.4.1.5
Siding backer board 2603.4.1.10
Stages and platform scenery .410.3.7
Surface burning characteristics 2603.3
Thermal barrier requirements .2303.4, 2603.5.2
Thickness .402.14.5.2
Trim 805.3, 2604
Walk-in coolers 2603.4.1.3

fOOD COURT .402.2
Occupant load .402.4.1.4

fOOTBOARDS 1008.13
IFOOT~NGS AND FOUNDATIONS ..1805, 1910.4.4.2
fORMWORK, CONCRETE 1906
FOUNDATION

Basement floor and wall loads 1610
Footing design 1801.2, 1805.4.1
Pier 1807.2
Pile (see P~lE FOUNDAT~ONS) 1807.2
Required for wood buildings 2308.6
Rodent-proofing Appendix F
Seismic provisions 1807.2.23, 1910.4.4.1
Soils investigation

(see SOilS) 1802.2.1, 1802.4
Special inspections 1704.4, 1704.8, 1704.9
Waterproofing and dampproofing 1806

FOYERS
Assembly occupancy 1008.3
Covered mall .402.1

FRATERNITIES, classification 310
FURNACE ROOMS 1007

G
GALLERIES

Assembly occupancy egress, means of ..1008.4
Exterior 1004.3.4
Stages .410.3.2,1007.5.1

740

GARAGE, AUTOMOBilE PARKING .406.2
Accessible provisions 1106.1, 1109
Barriers, vehicle .406.2.4, 1607.7.3
Beneath other occupancies .406.2.7, 508
Construction type .. .406.3.3, Table 503, Table 601
Guards .406.2.3
Enclosed .406.4
Occupancy separation 302.3, 508
Occupant load .Table 1003.2.2.2
Open .406.3
Occupancy separation private garage ..302.3.3
Sprinklers 903.2.11
Underground .405

GARAGE, REPAIR .406.6
Flammable gas detection system 406.6.6.3, 908.5
Sprinklers 903.2.10.1

GARAGES AND CARPORTS,
PRIVATE 302.3.~3, 406.1

Area limitations .406.1.2
GARAGES, TRUCK AND BUS

Live load 1607.6
Sprinklers 903.2.11.1

GATES 1003.3.2
GifT SHOPS 304, 407.2.4
GIRDERS

Fire resistance Table 601
Materials Chapter 6
Wood construction 2304.11.2.4, 2308.7

GLASS
Dead loads 2404
Fire doors 714.2.5
Fire resistant walls 714.3.6.2, 714.3.8
Fire windows , .714.3.6, 714.3.7
Floors and sidewalks 2409
Handrails and guards 2407
Identification 2403.1
Impact loads 2406.1, 2408.2
Jalousies 2403.5
Label/identification ..714.2.6.3, 714.2.5.1, 714.3.9
Louvered windows 2403.3
Non wired 714.3.3
Railings 2407
Replacement 2401.2, 3404
Safety 714.2.6.4, 2406
Skylights 2405
Sloped 2405
Snow loads 2404
Supports 2403.2
Testing 1714.5, 2406.1, 2408.2
Veneer 1405.11
Vertical 2404.1
Wind loads 2404
Wired .714.3.2

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



GLASS :BLOCK 2110
Atrium enclosure .404.5
Fire resistance 2110.1.1
Hazardous locations 2406, 2406.2.1
Material requirements 2103.5

GRADE (PLAINE) , 502
GRADE, LUMBER

(see LlJM~ER) 2302.1
GRAIN ELEVATORS .415.7.1.5
GRANDSTANDS, REVIEWING STANDS

AND BLEACHERS 1008.5
Accessibility 11'07.2.2
Definition 1002
Egress 1008.5
Exit signs 1003.2.10.1 (5)
Live load .Table 1607.1
Occupant load 1003.2.2.9
Open air 1008.5.3, 1008.6

GREENHOUSES
Area Table 503
Classification of 312.1
Deflections Table 1604.3
Membranes 3102.1
Plastic 2606.11
Roof live load 1607.11.2.1
Sloped glazing 2405

GRINDING ROOMS .415.7.1.2
GROSS LEASABLE AREA

(see COVERED MALL BUILDINGS) .402
GROUT 711.3.1, 711.4.1, 2103.10
GUARDS 1003.2.12

Equipment platform 505.5.3
Glass 2406.2(10),2407
Grandstands, reviewing

stands, and bleachers 1008.12
Landings 1003.2.12
Loads 1607.7
Mechanical equipment 1003.2.12.4
Opening limitations 1003.2.12.3
Parking garage .406.2.3
Plastic 2606.5
Ramps 1003.3.4.9
Residential 1003.2.12.1
Screen porches 1003.2.12.3
Structural design 1607.7
System, defined 1002.1

GUARDRAILS, VEHICULAR .406.2.3, 1607.7.3
GUTTERS 1503.4.1
GYMNASIUMS

Live load Table 1607.1
Occupant load 1003.2.2.2
Special occupancy Table 303.3.3(e)

separation
GYPSUM Chapter 25

Aggregate, exposed 2513

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

Board Chapter 25
Concrete, reinforced 1915
Construction 2508
Diaphragms 2305.2
Draftstopping 716.3.1
Exterior soffit Table 2506.2
Fastening 2211.4.3, 2306.4.5.1.4,

Table 2306.4.5, 2508.1
Fire resistance 720.2.1.4, 720.6.2A
Fire resistant joint treatment 2508.4
Inspection 2503
Lath 2507, 2510
Lathing and furring for 717, 2510

cement plaster
Lathing and plastering 2507
Materials 2506
Plaster, interior 2511
Plaster, exterior 2512
Shear wall Table 2211.12, 2306.4,

construction 2308.9.3, 2505
Sheathing 2304.6.1, 2211.4
Showers and water closets 2509
Stucco 2510
Veneer base 2507.2
Veneer plaster 2507.2
Vertical and horizontal assemblies 2504
Wallboard Table 2506.2
Water resistant backing 2506.2, 2509.1.2

board

H
HANDRAILS 1003.3.3.11, 1607.7

Assembly aisles , 1008.11
Alternatirg tread devices 1003.3.3.10
Glass 2407
Grandstands, reviewing

stands, bleachers 1008.11
Graspability 1003.3.3.11.3
Guards 1003.1 .12
Loads 1607.7
Plastic 2606.5
Projection 1003.3.3.11.7,1003.3.3.12
Ramps 1003.3.4.7
Stairs 1003.3.3.11
Walkway, site work 3306,2

HARDBOARD 1404.3.2, 2303.1.6
HARDWOOD

Fastening 2304.9
Quality 2301.4.7
Thermal barriers 2603.4
Veneer 1404.3.2

HIGH-HAZARD OCCUPANCY 307, 415
(GROUP H)
Classification 307
Combustible liquids .415.7.2

741



INDEX

Control areas .414.2
Conveyors .415.7.1.3
Corrosives Table 414.2.4, 414.3
Cryogenic fluids .Table 414.5.1, Table 415.9
Dispensing, use and handling .414.7.2
Dry cleaning (see DRY CLEANING)

Egress, special provisions .415.7.4
Emergency alarm systems 908.1
Exceptions 307.9
Explosives Table 414.5.1, Table 415.3.1
Exempt 307.9
Factory industrial F-1 moderate

Hazard occupancy 306.2
Factory industrial F-2 low hazard

occupancy 306.3
Fire alarm, manual 901.7.3
Flammable liquids .415.7.2
Flammable solids
Grinding rooms .415.7.1.2
Group H-1 307.3
Group H-2 307.4
Group H-3 307.5, 415.8
Group H-4 307.6. 415.8
Group H-5 307.7, 415.9
Health hazard materials . .415.2, Table 414.2.4,

415.4, 415.9.6.2, Table 415.9
Height 415.4, 415.5
Interior finishes .416.2.1, 416.3.1
Irritants Table 414.2.4, Table 415.9
Liquid, highly toxic and toxic .415.8.3, 908.3
Location on property .415.3
Multiple hazards 307.8
Organic peroxides Table 415.3.2,
Oxidizers, liquid and solid .414.5.4,

415.5.1,415.6
Permit drawings and specifications .
Pyrophoric materials .415.4.1, 415.5.1
Sensitizers .Table 415.9
Separation from other

occupancies .. Table 415.3.1 , 415.7.3.4.1, 415.9.5.9
Solids, highly toxic and toxic .415.8.3,

Table 415.9, 908.3
Special provisions H-2, H-3 .415.4, 415.5
Sprinklers 415.5.2,415.7.2.4

415.9.6.3, 415.9.9, 415.9.10.1,
415.9.11, 704.8.1, 903.2.4

Standby power systems 2702.2.9 - 2702.2.12
Storage and dispensing .414.1,

414.5,414.6
Tank protection .415.7.2.2,415.7.2.3
Unstable materials Table 414.2.4,

Table 414.5.1, Table 415.3.2,
415.5.1, 415.6, 415.9, Table 415.9.5.9

Water-reactive materials Table 414.5.1 .2,
Table 415.3.2, 415.5, 415.5.1, 415.5.2,

415.6, Table 415.9.5, 415.9
HAZARDOUS MATER~AlS .414

Control areas .414.2, 415.9.4.6
Explosion control .414.5.1, Table 414.5.1 ,

415.7.1.4,415.9.5.4

742

Special provisions .415.4, 415.5 _
Sprinklers Table 414.2.4,415.5.2,415.7.2.4 •
Ventilation Table 414.2.4, 414.3,

415.7.2.8, 415.9.2.6, 415.9.4.3,
415.9.5.7,415.9.6.3

Weather protection .414.6.1
HEAD JOINT, MASONRY

Bonding pattern 2109.6.5
Seismic 2106.5.2
Thickness 2104.1.2.1

HEADER,MASONR~{BONDER)

DEFINITION " 2102
HEADROOM

Means of egress 1002.2.5.1, 1003.3.4.4.2
Stairs 1003.3.3.2

HEALTH CARE
Clinics 304
Hospitals 308

HEALTH HAZARD MATERIALS 307.2
HEAT VENTS .415.6,910
HEAT~NG (see MECHANICAL)

Aircraft hangars .412.2.4
Parking garages .406.2.8
Repair garages .406.6.5

HEIGHT, BUILDING Chapter 5
Limitations 503 e
Mixed construction types 503.1
Modifications 504
Roof structures 504.3

HEIGHT, STORY 502.1
HELISTOPS 1005.2.1.2
HIGH PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE .413,

907.2.14, 910.2.3
HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS .403

Automatic fire detection .403.5, 907.2.12
Automatic sprinkler system .403.2
Elevators .403.9
Fire command station .403.8
Fire department communication .403.7
Seismic 1614
Smokeproof enclosure 1005.3.2.5
Sprinklers .403.3, 903.3.1.1
Stairway door operation .403.11
Standby power, light and

emergency systems .403.10, 2702.2.14
Voice alarm .403.6, 907.2.12
Zones 907.8.2

HORIZONTAL EXIT '1005.3.5
Accessibility 1003.2.13.1
Doors 1005.3.5.2
Fire resistance 1005.3.5.1 e
Institutional 1-3 occupancy .408.2, 1005.3.5
Institutional 1-2 occupancy 1005.3.5
Travel distance 1004.2.4

2000 ~NTERNATiONAL BUILDING CODE®



HORIZONTAL FIRE SEPARATION 704
Combustible projections 704.2

HOSE CONNECTIONS (see STANDPIPES)
HURRICANE SHUTTERS 1609.1.4

I
INCINERATOR ROOMS 1007.1
INDUSTRIAL (FACTORY-INDUSTRIAL

OCCUPANCY)
INSPECTIONS 109

Approval required 109.6, 1704.1
Atrium buildings 909.3
Concrete slab 109.3.2
EIFS 1704.12
Energy efficiency 109.3.7
Fees 108
Final 109.3.10
Fire-resistant materials 1707.11
Fire resistant penetrations 109.3.6
Footing or foundation 109.3.1
Frame 109.3.4
General 109.1
Lath or gypsum board 109.3.5, 2503
Liability 104.8
Pier 1704.9
Pile 1704.8, 1807.2
Preliminary 109.2
Reinforcing steel 1704.4
Required 109.3
Right of entry 104.6
Seismic 1707
Special 109.3.9, 1704.13
Sprinklers 904.4
Steel framing, cold-formed 1704.3
Steel, structural 1704.3, 1704.11.3.2
Third party 109.4
Wall palilels and veneers 1704.10
Welding 1704.3, 2208
Wood, structural 1704.6

INSTITUTIONAL OCCUPANCY (GROUP I) 308
Child care 308.3.1
Group 1-1 308.2
Group 1-2 308.3, 407
Group 1-3 308.4, 408
Group I·A day care facilities 308.5
Sprinkler system, automatic 903.2.5

INSTITUTIONAL 1-1 308.2
Emergency egress 1009.1
Fire alarm 907.2.6.1
Visible alarms 907.9.1.2
Sprinklers 903.2.5, 903.3.2

INSTITUTIONAL 1-2
Accessibility 1107.3.2
Combustible decorations 805.1
Corridor width 1004.3.3.3

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING COD~

INDEX

Exterior exit stair 1005.3.6.1
Fire alarm and detection 907.2.6
Special requirements .407
Sprinklers ~ 903.2.5, 903.3.2
Suites 1004.2.3.2
Openings in smoke barriers 909.5.2, 709.5

INSTITUTIONAL 1-3 308.4
Exit sign exemption 1003.2.10.1
Openings in smoke barriers 909.5.2
Special requirements .408

INSTITUTIONAL 1-4 308.5
Corridor rating 1004.3.3.1
Fire alarm 907.2.6
Sprinklers 903.2.5

INSULATION
Concealed 718.2
Duct insulation 718.1
Exposed 718.3
Foam plastic (see FOAM PLASTIC

INSULATION) 718.1
Penetrations 711 .3.4
Roof 718.5
Thermal 718
Wall insulation 2303.1.5.2

INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT
Lighting 1204
Rodent proofing Appendix F
Sound transmission 1206
Space dimensions 1207
Temperature control 1203
Ventilation 1202.5
Yards or courts 1205.2, 1205.3

INTERIOR FINISHES Chapter 8
Acoustical ceiling systems 803.8
Application 803.3, 804.4
Atriums .404.8
Decorative materials 801.1 .2, 805
Floor finish 804
Foam plastic insulation 2603.4
Foam plastic trim 805.3
Light-transmitting plastics 2606
Signs .402.13, 2611
Wall and ceiling finishes 803

INTERPRETATION, CODE 104.1

J
JOINTS, FIRE RESISTANT SYSTEMS 712

K
KIOSKS .402.10

L
LABORATORIES

Classification of 302
Hazardous materials .414

743



INDEX

Incidental use Table 302.1.1
Live load Table 1607.1

LADDERS, FIRE ESCAPE 3403
lAMINATIED TIMBER, STRUCTURAL

GLUED 602.4, 2301.3
lANDINGS

Doors 1003.3.1.5
Helistops 1005.2.1.2
Ramp 1003.3.4.5
Stair 1003.3.3.4, 1003.3.3.3.1,3403.4

lATH, METAL OR W~RE Chapter 25
lAUNDR~ES 304, Table 302.1.1
lAUNDRY CHUTE 707.13, 903.2.12.2
lEGAL (see UABIUTY)

Federal and state authority 102.2
Liability 104.8
Notice of violation 113.2, 115.3
Registered design professional ..106.1, 106.3.4
Right of entry 104.6
Unsafe buildings or systems 115
Violation penalties 113.4

UBRAR~ES

Other than school, classification 303.1
School, classification 305.1

UGHT, REQUIRED 1204.1
UGHT~NG, EMERGENCY

(see EMERGENCY LIGHTING)
UGHTS, PLAST~C CEILING DIFFUSERS ...2606.7
LINTEL

Adobe 2109.8.4.7
Fire resistance 713.6
Masonry 2104.1.5
Masonry, wood support 2304.12
Veneer 1405.5.1

lIQUEIF~IED PETROLIEUM GAS .415.7.3
UVE lOAD 1607

Deflections Table 1604.3
Load Combinations 1605

lOADS
Dead 1606
Flood 1612
Impact 1607.8
Live 1603.3, 1607
Pile foundation 1807, 1810
Rain 1611
Seismic 1603.1.5, 1613 - 1620
Snow 1608
Soil laferal 1610
Structural Chapter 16
Structural, combinations 1605
Wind 1603.1.4, 1609

LOBBIES
Assembly occupancy 1008.3
Elevator 707.14.1

744

LOCKS AND LATCHES 1003.3.1.8
Delayed egress locks 1003.3.18.2
Institutional 1-3 occupancy .408.4

LUMBER
General provisions Chapter 23
Quality 2302

M
MAINTENANCE

Accessibility 1103.2.9
MALL (see COVERED MALL BUILDINGS)
MANUAL FIRE ALARM BOX 907.3
MANUFACTURED HOMES

Flood resistant G501
MARQUEES 3106, H113
MASONRY

Adhered veneer 1405.9
Adobe 2109.8.1 - 2109.8.3
Anchorage 1604.8.2, 2106.2.1, 2109.7
Anchored veneer 1405.5
Ashlar stone 2102
Bond 2109.6
Cavity wall 2109.4.2
Chimneys 2111
Cold weather construction 2104.3
Compressive stress requirements 2109.3
Construction 2104, 2109.8.4
Construction documents 2101.3
Corbelled 2104.2
Dampproofing 1806
Design, methods 2101.2, 2106 - 2109
Fire resistance, calculated 720.3.2, 720.3.4
Fireplaces 2101.3.1, 2111
Floor anchorage 1604.8.2, 2109.7.3
Foundation walls 1805.5
Foundations adobe 2109.8.4.3
Glass unit 2101.2.4, 2103.5, 2110
Grouted 2102
Headers (bonders) 2109.6.2
Hollow units 2104.1.2.2
Hot weather construction 2104.4
Inspection 1704.5
Joint reinforcement 2103.11.2, 2106.4.2.3.1,

2108.9.2.2, 2109.7.2.3
Lateral stability 2109.2
Lateral support 2106.2.1, 2109.4
Lateral tie anchorage 2106.5.6
Materials 2103
Parapet walls 2109.5.5
Partition walls 2106.4.1.2, Table 1621.2
Penetrations 711, 711.3.1
Quality assurance 2105
Rodent-proofing Appendix F
Roof anchorage 1604.8.1,1620.1.7

2106.2.1, 2109.7.3

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



Rubble stone 2102
Running bond 2109.6.5, Table 2108.7.5
Seismic provisions 2106
Shear walls 1620.1.7, 2106.1.1, 2106.5.3
Solid 2104.1.2.3, 2109.6.2.1
Stack bond 2106.5.2, 2106.6, 2109.6.5.2
Stone 2103.3, 2109.8
Support (see MASONRY,

lATERAL SUPPORT) 2904.12
Surface bonding 2103.8
Test procedures 2105.2.2.2, 2105.4, 1711
Thickness 2109.5
Tie, wa'lI 2104.1.3, 2109.6.3
Veneer 2101.2.5, 2308.11.2
Wall anchorage 1604.8.2,1620.1.7,2109.7
Wall, composite 2102.1
Wall, hollow 2102.1
Wall, intersecting 2109.7.2
Waterproofing 1806
Weepholes ; ..2104.1.8
Wetting brick 2104.5
Wythe defined 2102.1

MATERIALS
Alternates 104.11
Aluminum , ..Chapter 20
Concrete Chapter 19
Glass Chapter 24
Gypsum Chapter 25
Masonry Chapter 21
Noncombustible 703.4
Plastic Cha~ter 26
Steel Chapter 22
Testing (see Testing) " 1715
Wood Chawter 23

MEANS OF EGRESS Chapter 10
Accessible 1003.2.13, 2702.2.5
Aisles 1004.3.1
Assembly 1008.1, 1008.2, Table 1008.5
Capacity 1003.2.3.1
Ceiling height 1003.2.4
Corridors 1004.3.2
Covered mall buildings .402.4
Doors 1003.3.1
Educational occupancy 308.5.2
Elevation change 1003.2.7
Elevators, escalators and

moving walks 1003.2.9
Emergency escape and rescue 1009
Emergency lighting values 3409.6.15
Enclosures under stairways 1005.3.2.2
Exit access 1004
Exit components 1005.3
Exit discharge 1006
Exit passageway 1005.3.3
Exit signs 1003.2.10

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

Exit doors 1005.3.1
Floor surface 1003.2.6
Gates 1003.3.2
Grandstands 1008.5
Guards 1003.2.12
Helistops 1005.2.1.2
Illumination 1003.2.11
Minimum width 1003.2.3.1
Occupant load 1003.2.2
Path of egress travel, common 1004.2.5
Protruding objects 1003.2.5
Ramps 1003.3.4
Residential aircraft hangars .412.3.3
Seating at tables 1004.3.1
Stage 1007.5
Stairways 1003.3.3
Temporary structures 3103.4
Travel distance 1004.2.4, 1008.6
Values 3409.6.11
Vertical exit enclosures 1005.3.2
Width 1003.2.3, Table 1003.2.3.1,

1008.5, 1008.8
MECHANICAL (see AIR CONDITIONING,

HEATING AND REFRIGERATION, AND
VENTILATION)
Air transfer openings 704.14, 705.11,

706.9, 715.4
Chimneys (see CHIMNEYS) 2113
Code Chapter 28
Equipment on roof 1509, 1510.2
Factory-built fireplace 2111.16.1
Fireplaces (see Fireplaces) 2111.1
Permit required 105.1
Room separation 302.1.1
Seismic attachment 1621.3.12.2
Seismic inspection and testi ng 1707.7
Smoke control systems 909
Systems Chapter 28

MEMBRANE ROOF COVERINGS 1507.11,
1507.12,1507.13

MEMBRANE STRUCTURES 2702.2.8, 3102,
MENTAL HOSPITALS, CLASSIFICATION ....308.3
MERCANTILE OCCUPANCY (GROUP M)

Area 505, 506, 507
Classification 309
Height 504, 508.4
Interior finishes Table 803.4
Sprinkler system, automatic 903.2.6

METAL
Aluminum Chapter 20
Roof coverings 1504.3.2, 1507.5
Veneer 1404.5

MEZZANINES 505
Accessibility 1104.4
Egress 505.3, 1003.2.2.8

745



Height modifications for 505.1
Stairs 707.2(9), 1003.3.3.10

M~RRORS 1003.3.1,2406.2.1 (7)
~~XED OCCUPANCY (see OCCUPANCY,
M~XEID)AND OCCUPANCY SEPARAT~ON)

MO~SrURE IPROTIEC1~ON 1403.2, 1503
2303.2.3, 2304.11

MONASTIE~~IES, ClASS~IF~CAlJION 310.1
MORlTA~

Ceramic tile 2103.4
Compressive stresses,

masonry Table 2103.7(2)
Dampproofing 1806
Fire resistance 711.3.1, 711 .4.1
Glass block 2110.6
Material 2103.7
Placing 2104.1.2
Rodent-proofing Appendix F
Surface-bonding 2103.8
Testing 2105.4

MOTlElS j ClASSIF~CATION 310.1
MOT~ON PICTURE PROJECTION ROOMS 409

Construction .409.2
Exhaust air .409.3.1.2
Lighting control .409.4
Projection room 409.3.1
Supply air .409.3.1.1
Ventilation .409.3

MOTOIrR VElHllClE RELATED USE
GROUPS 304, 311,406
MOV~NG, BlUl~llO~U\lGS D103.3
MOVING WAlKSj MEANS OF

EGRESS 1003.2.9, 3005.2

N
NA~UNG RIEQUIIAEMENTS 2304.9
NONCOMBUSTIBLE BUILDING MATERIAL ..703.4
NijJlRSllNIG HOMIESj ClASSIFICAT~ON 308.3

OCClUJPANCY
Accessory 302.2
Atriums .404.2
Certificates (see CIERT~FICATES

Of OCCUPANCY)
Change 3405
Floor loads Table 1607.1
Special Chapter 4

OCClUJPANCY CLASSIFICATION
Covered mall buildings .402
HPM 415.9
Mixed 302.3
Mixed occupancy values 3409.6.16
Special Chapter 4

746

OCCUPANCY SEPARATION
Covered mall building .402.7.2
Incidental use areas 302.1.1, 706.3.4
Parking garages .Table 302.3.3(c),

406.1.2, 406.2.7
Repair garages .406.6.2
Required fire resistance Table 302.3.3
Residential aircraft hangars .412.3.2

OCCUPANT lOAD
Certificate of occupancy 110
Covered mall building .402.4.1
Determination of 1003.2.2
Increased 1003.2.2.4
Signs 1003.2.2.5

OFFICE BlUllD~NGSjCLASSIFICATION OF ....304
OPENING PROTIECT~ONjEXTERIOR
WAllS 704.1

OPENING PROTIECT~ON,FLOORS
(see VERTICAL OPENING PROTIECTION)

OPENING PROTIECT~ON, INTERIOR WALLS
OPENING PROTIECT~VES 714

Automatic closing devices 714.2.7, 909.5.2
Fire door and shutter assemblies 714.2.8
Fire windows 714.3.6, 714.3.7
Glass 714.3
Glass block (see Glass block) 2110.1.1
Interior walls 708.6
Required fire resistance 714.2
Self-closing 714.2.7

ORGANIC COATINGS .418
ORGANIC PEROXIDES 307.4, 307.5
OXIDIZERSj LIQUID AND SOLID 307.2

~

PANIC HARDWARE 1003.3.1.9
PARAPET, EXTERIOR WAll 704.11, 2109.5.5

Construction 704.11.1
Fire wall 704.11, 705.6
Height 504.3
Seismic loads 1621.2

PARKING, ACCESSIBLE 1106
PARKING GARAGES (see GARAGlESj

AUTOMOBilE PARKING) .406.2
Classification .406.2.1
Barriers, vehicle .406.2.4
Guards .406.2.3
Height, clear .406.2.2
Mixed separation .406.2.7

PARKING GARAGESj OPEN .406.3
Area and height .406.3.5
Construction type .406.3.3
Stairs and exits .406.3.8
Standpipes .406.3.9

2000 INTERNATiONAL BUILDING COOE®



PARKING GARAGES, ENCLOSED .406.4
Heights and areas .406.4.1
Ventilation .406.4.2

PARTICLEBOARD
Draftstopping 716.3.1
Fastening 2304.9
Moisture protection 1403.2, 1405.2
Quality 2303.1.9
Seismic 2305
Shear walls 2306.4.3
Veneer 1405.4
Wall bracing 2308.9.3

PARTIT~ONS

Materials 602.4.6, 603.1
Occupancy, specific " 708.1
Seismic bracing 1621 .2.6.1
Structural 1607.13

PARTITIONS, FIRE ,' 708
Construction, general 703
Continuity 302.1.1.1, 708.4, 1004.3.3.6
Exterior walls Table 602, 704.5~ 708.5
Fire resistance rating of walls 603.1 (8), 708.3
Joints 712
Joint treatment gypsum 2508.4
Opening protection 714
Rated glazing 714.3

PASSA~EWAY, EXIT (s~,e EXIT) 1005.3.3
II

PASSENGER STATIONS, CLASSIFICATION
OF IPATIOCOVERS 303, 2606.10

PEDESTRIAN
Protection at construction site 3306
WalkwAys and tunnels ~ .3104

PENALTIES 113.4
PENETRATIONS 711

Fire partitions 708.7
Fire resistant assemblies 711.3
Nonfir~' resistant assemblies 711 .4.3

PENETRATION-FIRESTOP SYSTEM
Fire rated walls 711.3.2
Fire rated horizontal assemblies 711 .4.1.2

PERLITE Table 719.1 (1), Table 2507.2
PERMITS 105

Application for 104.2, 105.1, 105.3
Drawings and specifications 106.1.1
Expiration 105.5
Fees 108
Liability for issuing 104.8
Placement of permit 105.7
Plan review 104.2, 106.3
Suspension or revocation 105.6
Time limitations 105.3.2, 105.5

PIER FOUNDATIONS 1807, 1811
PILE FOUNDATIONS 1807

Base piles, enlarged concrete 1809.2
Caisson 1809.7

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

Composite 181 0
Concrete, cast-in-place 1809
Concrete-filled steel pipe and tube 1809.6
Concrete, precast 1808.2
Drilled or augered uncased 1809.3
Driven 1808, 1809.4
Pile load, allowable 1807.2.8
Seismic design 1807.2.23,

1808.2.2.2.1 - 1808.2.3.2.2
Steel-cased 1809.5
Steel, structural 1808.3
Timber 1808.1

PIPES
Embedded in concrete / 1906.3
Embedded in fire protection 713.3
Insulation covering 718.7
Penetration protection 711, 716.5, 1005.3.4.1
Under platform .410.4

PLAIN CONCRETE (see CONCRETE) ..Chapter 19
PLAN REVIEW 106.3
PLANT NURSERIES 304
PLASTER

Fire resistance requirements 717
Gypsum 717.1,717.2
Inspection 109.3.5
Portland

cement 717.5, Table 2507.2, 2808.9.3(7)
PLASTIC Chapter 26

Approval for use 2606.2
Finish and trim, interior 2604
Light-transmitting panels 2607
Plastic, 'light-transmitting)
Roofing 2609
Signs .402.12, 2611, 0102.2.10, H107,
Thermal barrier 2603.4
Veneer 1404.8, 2605, D102.2.11
Walls, exterior 2603.5

PLASTIC, FOAM
Insulation (see

FOAM PLASTIC INSULATION) 2603
Interior finish 2604
Malls .402.14.5

PLASTIC, LIGHT-TRANSMITTING
Awnings and patio covers 2606.10
Bathroom accessories 2606.9
Exterior wall panels 2607
Glazing 2608
Greenhouses 2606.11
Light-diffusing systems 2606.7
Roof panels 2609
Signs, interior 2611
Skylight 2610
Solar collectors 2606.12
Structural requirements 2606.5
Unprotected openings 2608.1, 2608.2

747



INDEX

Veneer, exterior 603.1 (15), 2605
Wall panels 2607

[PlATFORM 41 0
Construction .410.4
Temporary .410.4.1

IPlATFORM UFTS, WHEELCHAIR 1003.2.13.4,
1108.7

PLENUM
Underground buildings 907.2.18.1

PlUJMB~NG

Facilities, minimum 2902
Fixtures Table 2902.1
Residential aircraft hangars .412.3.5

IPlVWOOIO
Bracing 2308.9.3
Decorative 2303.3
Design requirements 2301
Diaphragm 2305.2, 2306.3
Fastening 2304.9
Fire retardant treated 2303.2
Lateral loads, steel studs 2211.3, 2311.7.4
Preservative-treated 2303.1.8.1, 2304.11
Quality 2303
Roof sheathing 2304.7, 2308.10.8
Seismic shear panels 2305.1.5 ,2305.3,

2308.12.4
Standards 2306.1
Subfloors 804.4.1
Veneer 1405.4

IPIRlIESCrR~PT!VIE f~RE RESISTANCE 719
IPlRlrESERVAT~VEmTREATEDWOOD

Fastenings 2304.9.5
Quality 2303.1.8
Required 1403.6, 2304.11
Shakes, roof covering 1507.9.5,1507.9.7

IPROJECT~ONROOMS
Motion picture .409

~ROJECT~ONS, COMBUSTIBLE 704.2.3, 1406.3
PROPERTY LINE, ASSUMED

(see IF~RE SEPARATION) 704.3
PROPERTY UNIE, COMMON

(see f~1A1E SEPARAT~ON)

IPROSCEN~UM

Opening protection .410.3.5
Wall .410.3.4

PUIBUC ADDRESS SYSTEM
Covered mall building 402.13, 2702.2.1.3
Special amusement buildings .411.6
Underground buildings .405.7

IPUIBUC PROPERTY Chapter 32, Chapter 33
~UIBUC R~GHlT Of WAY

Encroachments Chapter 32
IPYIROPHORIC MATERIALS 307.4, Table 307.7(1)

7418

R
RAILING (see GUARDRAil AND HANIDRAIL)
RAMPS 1003.3.4

Assembly occupancy 1008.9
Construction 1003.3.4.6
Existing buildings 3408.7.4
Parking garage .406.2.5
Slope 1003.3.4.1, 3408.8.5

REFERENCED STANDARDS Chapter 35
Applicability 102.4
Fire resistance 703.2, 720.7
List Chapter 35
Organizations Chapter 35

REFORMATORIES 308.4
REFRIGERATION (see MECHANICAL)

System machinery room 1007.2
REFUGE AREAS

(see AREAS OF REFUGE)
REFUSE CHUTE 707.13
REINFORCED CONCRETE

General 1901.2
Inspections 1704.4
Seismic design 1910

REINFORCEMENT
Concrete 1907
Glass block 2110.7
Masonry 2103.11

REPAIRS, BUILD~NG
Minor 105.2.2
Permit required 105.1

RESIDENTIAL CARE/ASSISTED LIVING
FACILlT~ES 308.1

Accessibility 1107.3
Fire alarms 907.2.6, 907.9.1.2
Separations Table 302.1.1, Table302.3.3
Smoke Alarms 907.2.10.1.3
Sprinklers 903.2.5, 903.3.2

RESIDENT HOUSING AREA, INSTITUTIONAL
!a3 OCCUPANCY

Accessibility 1107.3.3
Fire detection 907.2.6.2
Occupant load 1003.2.2.2
Subdivision .408.7

RES~DENTIAl OCCUPANCY (GROUP R) 310
Accessibility 1107.5
Area Chapter 5
Doors 1003.3.1.1
Draftstopping 716.4.2
Emergencyescape 1009.1
Height Chapter 5
Interior finishes Table 803.4
Parking under 508
Partitions 708.1
Smoke detectors 907.2.10
Sprinklers 903.1.2, 903.2.7

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUilDING CODE®



Unlimited height 508.4
Visible alarms 907.9.1.2

RETAINING WALLS 1610.2
REVIEWING STANDS

Egress 1003.5.3
Live load Table1607.1
Occupant load 1003.2.2.9
Temporary 107

RISER~, STAIR (see STAIRWAY CONSTRUCfION)
Closed 1003:'3.3.3.2
General 1003.3.3.3
Institutional 1-3 occupancy 1003.3.3.10
Open 1003.3.3.3.2

RODENT-PROOFING Appendix F
ROLL ROOFING 1507.6
ROOF ACCESS 1003.3.3.12.1
ROOF CONSTRUCTION

Construction walkways 3306.7
Coverings (see Roof Coverings) 1609.7.2
Deck 1609.7.1
Draftstopping 716
Fire resistance Table 601
Fireblocking 716.2
Live loads 1607.11 .2
Materials Chapter 6
Penetration of fire resistant assemblies 710.5
Projections 1608.8
Rain loads 1611
Roof structures 504.3, 1509, 0102.2.9
Signs, roof mounted H11 0
Slope, minimum Chapter 15
Snow load 1603.1.3
Wood (see Roof Construction, Wood)

ROOF CONSTRUCTION, WOOD 602.4.5
Anchorage to masonry 1604.8.2, 2109.7.3.3
Attic access 1208.2
Ceiling joists 2308.10.2
Diaphragms 2305.2, 2306.3.2
Fastening schedule 2304.9
Framing 2304,.10.3, 2308.10
Plank-and-beam 2306.1.2
Rafters 2306.1
Sheathing 2304.7, 2308.10.8
Trussed rafters 2308.10.7.1
Ventilation, attic ' ..1202.2
Wind uplift 2308.10.1

ROOF COVERINGS 1507
Asphalt shingles 1507.2
Built up 1507.10
Clay tile 1507.3
Concrete tile 1507.3
Fire resistance 1505
Flashing 1503.2, 1507.3.9, 1507.5.6
Impact resistance 1504.6
Insulation 1508

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

Liquid applied coating 1507.15
Membrane 3102
Metal panels 1507.4
Metal shingles 1507.5
Modified bitumen 1507.11
Plastics, light-transmitting panels 2609
Replacement/recovering 1510.3
Reroofing 1510
Roll ' 1507.6
Single-ply 1507.12
Slate shingles 1507.7
Sprayed polyurethane foam 1507.14
Thermoplastic single-ply 1507.13
Wind loads 1504.1, 1609.7
Wood shakes 1507.9
Wood shingles 1508.8

ROOF DRAINAGE 1503.4
ROOF PROTECTION FROM ADJACENT

CONSTRUCTION 3307.1
ROOF REPLACEMENT/RECOVERING 1510.3
ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP

STRUCTURES Chapter 15
Cooling towers 1509.4
Drainage 1503.4
Fire classification 1505
Height modifications 504.3
Impact resistance 1504.6
Materials , 1506
Parapet walls 1503.3
Penthouses 1509.2
Snow drift 1608.8
Tanks 1509.3
Towers, spires, domes and cupolas 1509.5
Weather protection 1503
Wind resistance 1504.1, 1609.7

ROOF VENTS 1004.2.4.1
ROOM DIMENSIONS 1207
ROOMING HOUSE 310

S
SAFEGUARDS DURING

CONSTRUCTION Chapter 33
Adjoining property protection 3307
Construction 3302
Demolition 3303
Exits 3310
Fire extinguishers 3309
Protection of pedestrians 3306
Sanitary facilities 3305
Site work 3304
Sprinkler system, automatic 3312
Standpipes 3311
Temporary use of streets, alleys,

and public property 3308
SCHOOLS (see EDUCATIONAL OCCUPANCY)

749



~NDE)(

SECQJfUlrV GIRl~U..IES 1003.3.1.3.5
SEISM~<C 1614 - 1623

Concrete 1910
Loads . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1614 - 1620
Masonry 2106
Piers or piles 1807.2.23
Quality assurance 1705
Steel 2212
Ties, concrete footings 1805.4.2.2
Ties, pile foundation 1807.2.23
Soils investigation 1802.2.6, 1802.2.7
Structural observations 1707
Structural testing 1708
Wood 2305, 2308.11 - 2308.12

SERV~C[E STATION .406.5
SHAfT (see SHAFT ENCLOSURE and VERT~CAl

OIPIENINIG [PROTECTION) 702
SHAfT ENCLOSURE (see VERTICAL OPENING

IPR01l"IEC1~ON) 707
Construction 707.11, 707.12
Elevators 707.14
Fire resistance rating 707.4
High-rise buildings .403.3.2
Materials 707.3
Penetrations 707.8, 715.5.3
Refuse and laundry chutes 707.12
Required 707.2

SHIEATIHl~NG

Clearance from earth 2304.11 .2.2
Fastening 2304.9
Fiberboard 2306.4.4
Floor 2304.7, 2308.8.6
Gypsum 2306.4.5.1.6
Moisture protection 2304.11.2.2
Particleboard 2306.4.3
Roof 2304.7
Roof sheathing 2308.10.8
Wall 2304.6.1, 2308.9.3
Wood structural panels 2303.1.4, 2211.3

SHOPP~NG CENTIERS 309
SHOTC~ETE 1914
SHllJTIIERS, !F~RE (see

Ojp)IE~UNG PROTECT~VES) 714.2
SIIDEWAU{S 105.2(6)
SiGNS 3107

Accessibility 1003.2.13.6, 1109,
E1107, E1109.2.2

An imated devices Hi 08
Area of refuge,

accessible 1003.2.13.5.5, 1109.1
Covered mall building .402.14
Doors 1003.3.1.8, 1003.3.1.8.2
Electrical H106
Elevators 1109.2, 1109.3
Exit 1003.2.10,2702.2.3

750

Floor loads 1603.3
Ground H109
Height limitation H1 09.1, Hi 09.4, H112.4
Illumination H106.1.1
Marquee H113
Occupant content, assembly 1003.2.2.5
Parking spaces 1109.1
Plastic 2611
Portable H114
Projecting H112
Roof H110
Stair identification 1005.3.2.4, 1109.3
Standpipe control valve 905.7.1
Wall H111

SITE IDRAW~NGS 106.2
SITE WORK 3304
SKYLIGHTS

Light, required 1204.1
Plastic 261 0
Protection from adjacent construction 3307.1
Rated assemblies 710.4

SLAB, COMPOSITE STEEL
DECK/CONCRETE 2205.2

SLAB ON GROUND, CONCRETE 1911, 2304.11.2.3
SLATE SHINGLES 1507.7
SMOKE BARRIERS 709, 715.5.4

Construction 709.4, 909.5
Doors 709.5, 714.2, 909.5.2
Duct penetration '715.5.5
Fire resistance rating 709.3
Materials 709.2
Openings 709.5, 909.5.2
Penetrations 709.6
Required .407.4, 408.6
Transfer grilles 715.5.5
Walls 709.4

SMOKE CONTROL 909
Atrium buildings .404.4, 907.2.13
Covered mall building " .402.9
High-rise 1005.3.2.5
Stages .410.3.7.2
Standby power systems 2702.2.2
Underground buildings .405.5, 907.2.19
Systems 909
Values 3409.6.10.1

SMOKE DAMPERS 715.2 - 715.5
Smoke barriers 715.5.4, 715.5.5

SMOKE DETECTORS
Atriums .404.6, 907.2.13
Covered mall 907.2.20
Elevator lobbies 907.2.18.1
High-rise buildings .403.5, 907.2.12
HPM .415.9.9
Institutional 1-2 .407.6
Multiple-station 907.2.10

2000 iNTERNATIONAL BUilDING CODE®



Residential aircraft hangars 907.2.21
Residential occupancies 907.2.10.1
Single-station 907.2.10
Smoke activated doors 714.2.7.3
Special amusement buildings .411.5
Under€Jround buildings 907.2.18

SMOKE EXHAUST SYSTEMS
Underground

buildipgs .405.5, 907.2.18, 909.2.1
SMOKE VENTS .415.6, 910
SMOKEPROOF ENCLOSURES 1005.3.2.5

Design 909.20.3
SNOW LO~D " 1608

Glass 2404
SOilS AND FOUNDATIONS Chapter 18

Classification 1802.3
Depth of footings ;1805.2
Excavation, grading and fill 1803
Expansive 1802.3.2, 1805.8
Footings and foundations 1805
Footings on or adjacent to slopes 1805.3
Foundation walls 1805.5
Foundations, pile and pier 1807
Grading 1803.3
Investigation 1802
Investigation, pile and pier 1802.2.4
Investigation, seismic 1802.2.6,

1802.2.7
Loadbearing values 1804
Soil boring and sampling 1802.5
Soil lateral load 1610
Testing, piles : 1807.2.8.3

SOUND TRANSMISSION 1206
SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION Chapter 31
SPIRAL STA~RS 1003.3.3.9 .

Stages .410.5.4
SPRAY-APPLIED FIRE RESISTANT MATERIALS

Inspection 1704.11
Steel column calculated

fire r~sistance 720.5.2.2
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS, AUTOMATIC 903

Exempt locations 903.3.1.1
Substitute for fire rating Table 601 (4)
Values 3409.6.17

SPRINKLERS, REQUIRED '" 903
Aircraft paint hangers .412.4
Aircraft hangars .412.2.6
Atrium building .404.3
Basements 903.2.12.1
Covered mall building .402.8
Garages .406;3.10, 903.2.10
HazardOUS occupancies 903.2.4
High-rise buildings .403.2, 903.2.12.3
Incinerator rooms Table 302.1.1
Laundry chutes, refuse chutes, termination

2000 INTIERNATIONAl BUILDING CODt:®

INDEX

rooms and incinerator rooms .707.12, 903.2.12.2
Multistory buildings 903.2.12.3
Spray finishing booth .416.4
Supervision (see

SPRINKLER SUPERVISION) 903.4
Underground buildings .405.3

SPRINKLERS, SUPERVISION 903.4
Service 901.6
Underground buildings .405.3

STAGES AND PLATFORMS .410
Alternating tread stairway .410.5.4
Dressing rooms .410.5
Egress .410.5.4, 1007.5
Fire barrier wall .410.5.1
Floor finish and floor covering 804.3
Platform, temporary .410.4.1
Platform construction .410.4
Proscenium curtain .410.3.5
Proscenium wall .410.3.4
Roof vents " .410.3.7.1
Scenery .410.3.6
Smoke control .410.3.7.2
Special provisions
Sprinkler system, automatic .410.6
Standpipes .410.7
Ventilation .410.3.7

STAIRWAY (see ALTERNATING TREAD,
STAIRWAY, and STAIRWAY CONSTRUCTION,
and STAIRWAY ENCLOSURE)

Exterior exitway 1005.3.6, 1006.1
Identification 1005.3.2.4
Width, minimum 1003.3.3.1

STAIRWAY CONSTRUCTION
Aisle 1008.7.2
Alterations 3402.4
Alternating tread 1003.3.3.10
Circular 1003.3.3.7
Elevators 3002.7
Enclosure under 1005.3.2.2
Fireblocking 716.2.4
Handrails 1003.3.11
Headroom 1003.3.3.2
Illumination 1204.4
Landings 1003.3.3.4
Projections 1003.3.3.11.7
Seismic wood 2308.17
Spiral .408.3.3, 1003.3.3.9
Treads and risers 1003.3.3.3
Width 1003.3.3.1
Winders 1003.3.3.8

STAIRWAY ENCLOSURE
Access 1005.3.2.5.2
Construction 1005.3.2.2
Discharge 1006.1
Doors, automatic closing 714.2.7

751



INDEX

Elevators within 3002.7
Fire resistant construction 1005.3.2
Penetrations 1005.3.4
Space below, use 1005.3.2.2
Ventilation 1005.3.4.2

STANDBY POWER
Atriums .404.7
Covered mall building .402.12
Elevators 3003.1
Hazardous occupancy .414.5.4
High-rise .403.10
Group 1-3 .408.4.2
Stages .410.3.7.2,909.11
Underground buildings '.405.9.3

STANDP~PE AND HOSE SYSTEMS
(see STANDP~P>ES, IREQU~RED) 905

Class
Dry 905.8
Hose connection location ..905.1, 905.4 - 905.6
Locks 905.7.2

STANDP~PIES, REQUIRED
Assembly 905.3.3, 905.5.1
Covered mall buildings 905.3.4
During construction 905.10
Stages 905.3.5
Underground buildings .405.11, 905.3.6

STATE lAW 102.2
STEEL Chapter 22

Bolting 2209
Cables structures 2207
Calculated fire resistance 720.5
Cold-formed 2205, 2211
Conditions of restraint 703.2.3
Deck/concrete composite slabs 2205.2
High strength bolts 1704.3.3
Identification and protection 2203.1
Inspection, concrete reinforcement 109.3.1
Joists 2206
Lateral resistance, steel stud walls 2211
Open web joist 2206
Parapet walls 1503.3
Piles 1808.3
Reinforcement, concrete 1907
Seismic provisions 2211 - 2213
Storage racks 2210
Structural 2204
Studs/gypsum wallboard 2211.4
Studs/wood structural panel 2211.3
Welding 2208

STONE VENIEER 1405.6
Slab-type 1405.7

STOP WORK ORDERS 114
STORAGE OCCUPANCY (GROUP S) 311

Area Chapter 5
Automobile parking garage .406

752

Hazard storage, Group S-1, moderate 311.2 _,
Hazard storage, Group S-2, low " .311.3 _
Height Chapter 5
High piled combustible .413
Floor loads Table 1607.1
Interior finishes Table 803.4
Smoke and Heat Vents 910.2
Sprinkler system, automatic 903.2.11
Travel distance increase 1004.2.4.1

STRUCTURAL DESIGN
Aluminum Chapter 20
Concrete Chapter 19
Foundations Chapter 18
Masonry Chapter 21

STRUCTURAL FRAME INSPECTION 109.3.4
STRUCTURAL LOAD COMBINATIONS 1605
STRUCTURAL TESTS AND SPECIAL
INSPECTIONS Chapter 17

Alternative test procedure 1711
Approvals 1703
Design strengths of materials 17010
General 1701
In-situ load tests 1713
Material and test standards 1715
Preconstruction load tests 1714
Quality assurance 1705, 1706 ...
Special inspections 1704, 1707 _
Structural observations 1709
Structural testing 1708
Test safe load 1712

STRUCTURES, EXISTING Chapter 34
Accessibility 3408
Additions, alterations or repairs 3402
Change of occupancy 3405
Glass replacement 3404
Historic buildings 3406
Maintenance 3408.2
Moved structures 3407
Unsafe 115

STUCCO 2512
SWIMMING POOL, GLASS 2406.2(9)
SWIMMING POOL, ENCLOSURES Chapter 31

Gates, access 3109.4.1.7
Indoor 3109.4.3
Public 3109.3
Residential 3109.4

T
TELEPHONE EXCHANGES

CLASSIFICATION 304
TEMPORARY STRUCTURES 3103

Certificate of occupancy 107.3 a
Conformance 107.2 _
Permit 107.1
Power, temporary , .107.3
Structures ..31 03

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



•

Termination of approval ; 107.4
TENANT SEPARATION

Covered mall buildings 1.708.1
TENTS

Temporary 2702.2.8
TERMITE, PROTECTION FROM 2304.11
TERRA COTTA 1405.8
TESTING

Building official required 104.11.1
Concrete 1905.6.2.4, 1905.6.5.2
Fire resistant materials 703.2
Glass 2406
Roof tile 1715.2
Seismic 1708
Smoke control, atrium buildings 909.3
Sprinklers ; .904.4
Soils 1802
Structural Chapter 17

THEATERS (see PLATFORM, AND PROJECTION
ROOMS, AND STAGES) 303

THERMAL BARRIER, FOAM PLASTIC
INSULATION 2603.5.2

THERMAL-AND SOUND-INSULATING
MATERIAlS 718

Cellulose loose-fill insulation 718.6
Loose-fill insulation 71804
Roof insulation 718.5

THROUGH-PENETRATIONS
Air ducts 715.6.1
Fire barriers ;.706.7
Fire rated walls 711.3.1
Fire rated horizontal assemblies 711.4.1
Firestop system 711.3.1.2, 711.4.1.2

TilE
Ceramic, (see CERAMIC TILE)
Fire resistance, clay or shale 719.1

TOILETS
Accessible ; :1108.2
Grab bars 1607.7.2
Rooms openings 1209.5
Unisex 1108.2.1

TOWERS
Airport traffic control .412.1
Construction 3108.3
Dead Load 3108.4.1
G~ounding 3108.5
Location and access 3108.2
Radio 3108
Television 3108
Wind load 3108.4.2

TOWERS, COOLING 1509.4
TOXIC MATERIALS

Classification 307.6
Gas detection system 908.3
Separqtion 0415.8.3

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

INDEX

TRAVEL DISTANCE .
Factory-Industrial occupancy, increase1004.2.4.1
Mall .402
Mall tenant space .402.4.4
Measurement 1004.2.4
Storage occupancy, increase 1004.2.4.1

TREADS, STAIR (see STAIRWAY CONSTRUCTION)
TRUSSES

Fire resistance 713.2.3
Materials Chapter 6
Metal plate connected parallel wood 2303.4
Trussed rafters 2308.10.7.1

TUNNELED WALKWAY 3104

U
UNDERGROUND BUILDINGS 405

Compartmentation .405.4
Construction type .405.2
Elevators .405.4.3
Emergency power loads .405.10
Exits .405.8
Fire alarm systems .405.6
Fuel supply .405.9.2
Public address .405.7
Smokeproof enclosure 1005.3.2.5
Smoke exhaust .405.5.2, 907.2.19
Sprinkler system, automatic 0405.3
Standby power .405.9.3, 2702.2.15
Standpipe system .405.11
Voice alarms 907.2.19

UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT
(see STRUCTURES, UNSAFE) 115

Appeals 112, Appendix B
Stop work orders 114.1
Restoration 115.5
Revocation of permit 105.6
Utilities disconnection 111.3

UNSTABLE MATERIALS 307.3
UNUSABLE SPACE 710.3.2
USE AND OCCUPANCY Chapter 3

Accessory 302.2
Incidental 302.1.1, Table 302.1.1
Mixed 302.3

UTILITY AND MISCELLANEOUS
OCCUPANCY(GROUP U) 312,

Agricultural buildings Appendix C
Egress illumination 1003.2.11
Sprinkler system, automatic 903.2.12

UTILITIES 111
Service connection 111.1
Service disconnection 111.3
Temporary connection 111.2

753



INDIEX

V
VAllLJlA1r~ON OR VALUE (see FEES) 108.3
VAPOR !RETARDER 1403.3
VlEHWCllE SHOW ROOMS 304
VIENlEfElRl

Glass 1405.11
Cement plaster 1405.14
Masonry, adhered 1405.9
Masonry, anchored 1405.5
Metal 1405.10
Plastic 2605
Seismic coefficient Table 1621.2
Vinyl 1405.13
Wood 1405.4

VIEN1r~lAr~ON (see MEC~ANICAl)

Atrium .
Attic 1202.2, 2308.10.10
Bathrooms 1202.4.2.1
Crawl space 1202.3
Elevator hoistways 3004
Enclosed parking garages .406.4.2
Exit enclosure 1005.3.4.2
Exhaust, hazardous 1202.5
Exhaust, HPM .415.9.10.2
Fabrication areas, HPM .415.9.2.6
Hazardous, storage and dispensing .414.3
High-rise 1005.3.2.5
HPM Service Corridors .415.9.4.3
Mechanical 1202.1
Natural 1202.4
Projection rooms .409.3
Repair garages .406.6.3
Smokeproof enclosures 909.20.3,909.20.5
Stages 410.3.7
Under-floor ventilation 1202.3

VlENTS, PENET~ATION PROTECTION 711
VERMICUlUflE, FIRE RESISTANT 719
VlERT~CAl OPEN~NG PROTECTION

Atriums .404.5
Duct penetrations 715.1
Elevators 707.14
Institutional 1-3 occupancy .408.5
Shaft enclosure 707
Value 3409.6.6.1

VESfIBlUllLES, Ej{~T DISCHARGE 1006.1
V~NVl

Expanded 802, 803.6
Rigid 1405.13

V~OlAr~ONS 113
VOICIE ALARM (see ALSO ALARMS, VOICE)

Amusement buildings, special .411.6
Covered mall buildings .402.13
High-rise buildings 907.2.12
Underground buildings 907.2.19.1

754

W
WALKWAY, COVERED, ENCLOSED AND
TUNNELED WAll BEARING 3104

Fire resistance Table 601
Materials per construction type Chapter 6
Opening protection 714

WALL, EXTERIOR 704
Bearing Chapter 6
Coverings 1405
Fire resistance ratings 704.5, 706, 1403.5
Flashing, veneered walls 1405.3
Foam plastic insulation 2603.4.1.4, 2603.5
Light-transmitting plastic panels 2607
Materials 704.4, 1406
Nonbearing Chapter 6
Opening protection 704
Projections 704.2
Structural stability ~ 704.6
Vapor retarder 1403.3
Veneer (see Veneer) 1405.4, 1405.5,

1405.6, 1405.10
Weather resistance 1403.2, 1405.2
Weather resistant barriers 1405.2

WAll, fiRE (see FIRE WAll)
WAll, fiRE RESISTANT, PENETRATIONS 711.3
WAll, FOUNDATION 1805.5
WAll, INTERIOR

Opening protection 714
WAll, ~NTERIORNONBEARING (see PARTITION)
WAll, MASONRY

Lateral stability 2109.2
Lateral support 2109.4, 2106
Shear 2109.2.1.2
Wood contact 2304.11.2.3, 2304.11.2.4

WAll, PARAPET 704.11, 1503.3, 2109.5.5
WAll, PARTY (see Fire Wall) 705.1

Fire resistance 705
WAll, RETAINING Chapter 18, 2304.11.7
WAll SIGNS H111
WAll, VENEERED (see VENEER) Chapter 14
WAll, WOOD CONSTRUCTION

Bracing 2~308.9.3

Cutting, notching, boring 2308.9.10
Exterior framing 2308.9
Fastening schedule 2304.9
Framing 2304.3, 2308.9.2
Interior bearing partition 2308.9.1
Interior nonbearing partition 2308.9.2.3
Opening, framing 2308.9
Seismic provisions 2305,2306,2308
Shear walls 2305.3, 2306.2
Sheathing (see Sheathing)
Studs 2306.2, 2308.9.1
Top plates 2308.9.2.1

WATERaREACTIVE MATERIALS Table 307.7(1)

2000 INTERNATIONAL IBUllDING CODIE®

•



•

WEATHER, COLD
Concrete construction 1905.12
Masonry construction 2104.3

WIEATHER, HOT
Concrete construction 1905.13
Masonry construction 2104.4

WEATHER PROTECTION
Exterior walls 1405.2
Roofs 1503

WEEPHOLES 2104.1.8
WIELDING, STEEL 1704.3.1
WIND BORNE DEBRIS 1609.1.4
WIND LOAD 1609

Exposure category 1609.4
Glass 2404.1
Glass block 2110.3.1
Roofs 1504.1, 1609.7, 2308.10.1
Wind borne debris 1609.1.4

WINDERS, STAIR (see STAIRWAY
CONSTRUCTION)

WINDOW ..........•...............1003.3.3.8
Emergency egress 1009
Exterior, structural testing 1714.5
Fire (see OPENING

PROTECTIVES) 714.3.6, 714.3.7
Glass (see GLASS) 1405.12
Operable 1108.13.1
Required, light and ventilation 1204.2
Wells 1009.5

WIRES, PENETRATION PROTECTION 711
WOOD Chapter 23

Assemblies, calculated fire resistance 720.6
Bracing, walls 2308.9.3
Ceiling framing 2308.10
Connections and fasteners 2304.9
Contacting concrete, masonry,
or earth 2304.11.4

Decay, protection against 2304.11
Diaphragms 1620.2, 2306.3
Draftstopping 716.3, 716.4
End-jointed lumber 2303.1.1
Fiberboard 2303.1.5,2306.4.4
Fire retardant treated 2303.2
Fireblocking 716.2
Floor and roof framing

(see FLOOR CONSTRUCTION,
WOOD) 2304.4

Floor sheathing 2304.7
Foundation 1805.4.6, 2308.3.3.1
Grade, lumber 2303.1.1
Hardboard 2303.1.6
Heavy timber construction 2304.10
Hurricane Shutters 1609.1.4
Inspection 1704.6
I-joist 2303.1.2

2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING COD~

INDEX

Lateral force resisting systems 2305
Light-frame construction, conventional 2308
Load and resistance factor design 2307
Moisture content 2303.1.8.2, 2303.2.5
Nails and staples 2303.6
Particleboard shear walls 2306.4.3
Plywood, hardwood 2303.3
Preservative-treated 1403.6, 2303.1.8
Roof framing

(see ROOF CONSTRUCTION,
WOOD) 2304.4

Roof sheathing 2304.7
SeismiC provisions 2305, 2306

2308.11 - 2308.12.9
Shearwalls 2305.3, 2306.4
Standards and quality, minimum 2303
Stress design, allowable 2306
Structural panels 2303.1.4
Supporting masonry 2304.12
Termite, protection against 2304.11
Testing, structural 1714
Trusses 2303.4,

2308.10.7
Veneer Chapter 14
Wall framing

(see WALLS, WOOD
CONSTRUCTION) 2304.3

Wall sheathing 2304.6
Wood supporting masonry or concrete .2304.12
Wind provisions 2306.2

WOOD SHINGLES AND SHAKES 1505.6,
1507.8, 1507.9

WOOD STRUCTURAL PANELS
(see WOOD) 2303.1.4

Steel stud 2211.3

Y
YARDS OR COURTS 704.3,1205

755



756 2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

•



Page 1 of  24

ERRATA TO THE
2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

(Updated March 12, 2003)

Sixth Printing

Section 715.3.1.1, Items 1 and 3.  Item 1, 2nd line and Item 3, 4th line change “(10EC)” to “(28EC)”

Section 1707.7.1.  In the 1st sentence add the word “is” after “special inspection.”  Delete the last three lines of the
paragraph.  The paragraph is to end after “Section 1621.1.6” at the end of the 4th line.  Sentence to read:
“Special inspection is required...accordance with Section 1621.1.6.”

Chapter 35 Referenced Standards.

AISC

AISC Seismic (1997) Change “Supplement No. 2 dated 2000" to “Supplement No. 1 dated 1999"
NOTE: This same correction applies to and should be made to the referenced standard as published in the
IBC 3rd printing and in the IBC 5th printing.

Fifth Printing

*Section 115.1.   In the 1st sentence change the word “unsanitary” to “insanitary.”

Section 307.2.  In the definition for PYROPHORIC, change the temperature from “13EF (11EC)” to “130EF (54EC).”

Figure 720.2.1.3.1.  In the lower graph change “3/4 INCH JOINT WIDTH” to “3/8 INCH JOINT WIDTH.”

Section 720.5.2.2, (Equation 7-17).  In the numerator enclose “W1/D1" in parenthesis - the numerator to read:
“(W1/D1) + 0.60"
In the denominator enclose “W2/D2" in parenthesis - the denominator to read: “(W2/D2) + 0.60"

Table 1003.2.2.2.  Under the OCCUPANCY heading for “Airport terminal,” change the “FLOOR AREA IN SQ. FT.
PER OCCUPANT” to read as follows:

Baggage claim from “100" gross to “20" gross
Baggage handling from “15" gross to “300" gross
Concourse from “20" gross to “100" gross
Waiting areas from “300" gross to “15" gross

Table 1607.1.  In the OCCUPANCY OR USE column, Item 27. Residential, under the listing for “Hotels and
multifamily dwellings” after “Private rooms” add: “and corridors serving them.”  Listing to read: “Private rooms
and corridors serving them”

Table 1609.6.2.1(1).  At entry for: 110 BASIC WIND SPEED, Transverse LOAD DIRECTION, 20E ROOF ANGLE,
VERTICAL LOADS, End zone, Leeward roof, change “16" to “-16.”

Figure 1615.1.4.  Change the equation “Sa=SD1/T” to read: “Sa=SD1/T.”  

Section 1615.1.5, Equation 16-22.  Change quotient in equation from “   ÿ” to read: “   S .”V V



Page 2 of  24

Table 1617.6.  At entry for: BASIC SEISMIC-FORCE..., 1. Bearing Wall Systems, B. Special reinforced concrete...,
SYSTEM LIMITATIONS..., column Fe, change “160" to “100.”

Table 1617.6.  At entry for: BASIC SEISMIC-FORCE..., 2. Building Frame Systems, H. Ordinary plain concrete...,
SYSTEM LIMITATIONS..., column A or B, change “NP" to “NL.”

Section 1621.1.6.  At 2nd listing for Ip factor change “exempted amounts” to “maximum allowable quantities.”
Sentence to read: “Component contains...the maximum allowable quantities for an open system...”

Section 1621.2.1, Exception.  In the 7th line delete “swing” before “45 degrees” and add “of swinging,” and delete
the comma after “vertical.”  Sentence to read: “...12 inches (305 mm) or of swinging 45 degrees off vertical
without damage...”

Section 1621.2.5.2.2.  Item 3, Exception, 1st sentence:  Delete “may be used” and replace with “shall be permitted”
Sentence to read: “Rigid braces shall be permitted instead of...”

Section 1621.3.12.1.  In the 1st sentence of the 2nd paragraph (4th line) change “exempted amounts” to “maximum
allowable quantities.”  Sentence to read: “Components of mechanical equip...that exceed the maximum
allowable quantities for an open system...”

Section 1704.5.1.  Delete “listed in” after “essential facilities” ; delete “s” from “Tables” ; delete referenced table
“1617.6" and replace with “Section 1616.2" ; add “see” before “Table 1604.5" ; enclose “see Table 1604.5
and Section 1616.2" in parenthesis.  Sentence to read: “...in essential facilities (see Table 1604.5 and
Section 1616.2) shall comply with Table 1704.5.1.” 

Section 1704.5.2.  Delete “s” from “Tables” ; delete referenced table “1617.6" and replace with “Section 1616.2."
Sentence to read: “...in essential facilities (see Table 1604.5 and Section 1616.2) shall comply with Table
1704.5.1.”

Section 1704.5.3.  Delete “s” from “Tables” ; delete referenced table “1617.6" and replace with “Section 1616.2."
Sentence to read: “...in essential facilities (see Table 1604.5 and Section 1616.2) shall comply with Table
1704.5.3.”

Section 2109.5.5.2.  Change referenced sections “1504.2, 1504.3 and 1504.4" to “1503.2, 1503.3 and 1503.4.”

Table 2304.9.1.  At Item 6, Sole plate to joist or blocking at braced wall panel, in the column heading FASTENING
add the number “4" for required fasteners as follows:

4 - 3" x 0.131" nails per 16"
4 - 3" 14 gage staples per 16"

Table 2306.3.1.  Note b, change “nails” to “fasteners.”

Table 2306.4.1.  Note b, change “nails” to “fasteners” in two places.  Note g, change “nailing” to “fastening.”

Section 2308.2.1.  Revise title of referenced  AF&PA Manual as follows: “... of the AF&PA Wood Frame
Construction Manual (WFCM) For One- and Two-Family Dwellings, SBC High Wind Edition, or...”

Table 2308.8(1).  Under the listing for SPECIES AND GRADE - Southern Pine #2; DEAD LOAD = 10 psf; 2 x 12,
change the “Maximum floor joist span” from “18-8" to “24-2.” 

Section 2902.1.1.  In the 2nd sentence change the referenced section from “404" to “1108.2.1.” 

Fourth Printing



Page 3 of  24

Section 402.6.  In the 2nd line add a comma after “buildings,” and in the 3rd line delete the comma after “construction.”
Sentence to read: “...covered mall building, including anchor buildings, of Types I, II, III and IV construction
shall not be...”

Table 719.1(2).  Item 12-1.3 and Item 12-1.4 delete the reference to Note “f.”  In Note “f”, in the first line, change
the reference to “Note 6" to “Note 3.”

Table 1003.2.2.2.  Under the OCCUPANCY heading for “Airport terminal,” change the “FLOOR AREA IN SQ. FT.
PER OCCUPANT” to read as follows:

Baggage claim from “100" gross to “20" gross
Baggage handling from “15" gross to “300" gross
Concourse from “20" gross to “100" gross
Waiting areas from “300" gross to “15" gross

Section 1605.3.2.  In the next to the last sentence before the listing of the formulas change the coefficient
designation “w” to the Greek symbol “? ” omega.

Section 1607.4.  In the 3rd line change the referenced section from “1607.2" to “1607.3.” 

Table 1615.1.2(2).  In the heading of the 2nd column change “Ss” to “S1.”

Section 1621.2.5.2.  In the last sentence delete “the following” and replace with “Sections 1621.2.5.2.1 and
1621.2.5.2.2.”  Sentence to read: “...constructed in accordance with Sections 1621.2.5.2.1 and
1621.2.5.2.2.”

Table 2103.7(1).  Under the heading at the top of the table for “masonry cement”, in the right hand column designated
“N”, add the numeric value “1" in the bottom row labeled “masonry cement” at the 1st “MORTAR TYPE” “M”
and the 1st “MORTAR TYPE” “S” at the top and middle of the bottom row, and at “MORTAR TYPES” “N” and
“O” at the bottom of the row.

Section 2304.11.9.  Change the referenced section from “1202.4" to “1202.3.”

Third Printing

Section 311.3.  Delete “only” in the last sentence and replace with “not.”  Sentence to read: “... include, but are not
limited to, storage...”

Section 506.1.  In the definition for “If” delete “(percent).”  Definition to read: “...to frontage as calculated in...”

Section 506.2.  In the definition for “If” delete “(percent).”  Definition to read: “Area increase due to frontage.”

Section 506.3.  In the definition for “(Is = 200 percent)” and “(Is = 300 percent)” delete “percent.”  Definitions to read:
“(Is = 200)” and “(Is = 300).”

Table 601.  At requirement for roof construction under Type IIB delete the reference to note “c.”

Section 909.8.5. (Equation 9-7).  In the explanation of variables, revise as follows:
“Tc = Plum centerline.......
      = 0.60(Ta + 460) Qc

2/3z -5/3 + Ta”
and
“For SI:     Tc = 0.08Ta Qc

2/3z-5/3 + Ta”



Page 4 of  24

Table 1505.1.  At the last line in Note “c” change referenced section from “1505.6" to “1505.7.”

Table 1507.2.  Note a, Item 2: Change referenced table from “1609.5" to “1604.5.”  Add symbol “IW” after the term
“Importance Factor.”

Section 1509.2.1.  In Exception 1, line 7 and Exception 2, line 6: delete “over” before “20 feet” and add “or greater”
before the word “from.”  Sentence to read: “...that are 20 feet (6096 mm) or greater from a common...”

*Section 1604.4.  In the 3rd line of the 4th paragraph change “regidities” to “rigidities.”

Section 1605.4.  Delete “due to” in line 5 and replace with “calculated using.”  In line 7 add “those calculated using”
before “Formula 16-20."  Sentence to read: “...components shall be designed to resist the forces calculated
using Formula 16-19 when the ...forces and those calculated using Formula 16-20...”

Table 1607.1.  Item 24: Delete “and canopies”

Section 1607.4.  In the first sentence change referenced section from “1607.2" to “1607.3.”

Table 1609.1.4.  In heading for the 3rd column after “2 feet”, change symbol from “#” to “<.”

Table 1609.6.2.1(2).  Change the load for: Roof > 10 to 30 Degrees, Zone - 3, Wind Area - 20, Wind Speed - 130,
from “-53.5" to “-53.3.”

Section 1615.1.5, Equation 16-22.  Change quotient in equation from “   ÿ” to read: “   S .”V V

Section 1617.4.1.1.  At the definition for “S1" (Equation 16-38) add “mapped” before “maximum.”  Definition to read:
“S1 = The mapped maximum considered...”

Table 1904.4.1.  In the heading for the 2nd column change the chemical symbol for chloride ion from “CL” to “Cl.”

Section 2109.1.1.  In Condition 2 change “145 km/hr” to “48.4 m/s.”

Section 2110.1.1.  In the first sentence change “fire separation assemblies” to “fire barriers.”

Table 2304.6.1.  Change minimum thickness for fiberboard from “1½ inch“ to “½ inch.”

Section 2306.1.  At reference standard “TPI 1" delete the referenced year “1995.”

Table 2306.4.1.  At the entry for Structural 1 Sheathing, 15/32 Nominal Panel Thickness, 1 3/8 Fastener Penetration:
delete the entry for 10d nails and the associated values.

At the entry for Structural 1 Sheathing, 7/16 Nominal Panel Thickness, 1 3/8 Fastener Penetration, Panel
Applied over Gypsum Sheathing, 3 inch edge spacing (550): add reference to Note “f.”

At the entry for Structural 1 Sheathing, 15/32 Nominal Panel Thickness, 1 3/8 Fastener Penetration, Panels
Applied Direct to Framing, 3 inch edge spacing (550): delete reference to Note “f.”

At the entry for Sheathing, Plywood Siding, 15/32 Nominal Panel Thickness, 1 3/8 Fastener Penetration,
Panels Applied Direct to Framing, 3 inch edge spacing (490): delete reference to Note “f.”

At the entry for Sheathing, Plywood Siding, 3/8 Nominal Panel Thickness, 1 3/8 Fastener Penetration, Panels
Applied Direct to Framing with 8d galvanized “casing” nails, 3 inch edge spacing (310): delete reference to
Note “f.”



Page 5 of  24

Table 2306.4.1.  In Note “c” add “panel thickness” after “3/8-inch” and add “with a span rating of” before “16 inches.”
Note to read:  “c.  3/8-inch panel thickness or siding with a span rating of 16 inches o.c. is minimum...”

Section 2308.2.  Item 4: Change “161 km/hr” to “44 m/s”
Item 4, Exception: Change “177 km/hr” to “48.4 m/s”

Table 2308.9.5.  In the 3rd line of the table heading delete “header” following “Maximum.”  Note to read: “(Maximum
span for douglas...”

Change the span ratings and number of required NJ for listings at “4-2x8" headers as follows:

TABLE 2308.9.5
HEADER AND GIRDER SPANSa FOR EXTERIOR BEARING WALLS

(Maximum span for Douglas Fir-Larch, Hem-Fir, Southern Pine, and Spruce-Pine-Firb and required number of jack studs)

HEADERS
SUPPORTING SIZE

GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)e

30 50

Building widthc (feet)

           20                             28                            36             20                            28                           36

Span NJd Span NJd Span NJd Span NJd Span NJd Span NJd

Roof & Ceiling 4-2×8 9-2 1 8-4 1 7-8 1 8-4 1 7-5 1 6-8 1

Roof Ceiling
and 1 Center-
Bearing Floor

4-2×8 8-1 1 7-3 1 6-7 1 7-5 1 6-6 1 5-11 2

Roof, Ceiling
and 1 Clear
Span Floor

4-2×8 7-2 1 6-3 2 5-7 2 7-0 1 6-1 2 5-6 2

Roof, Ceiling
and 2 Center-
Bearing Floors

4-2×8 6-10 1 6-0 2 5-5 2 6-8 1 5-10 2 5-3 2

Roof, Ceiling
and 2 Clear
Span Floors

4-2×8 5-7 2 4-10 2 4-4 2 5-6 2 4-9 2 4-3 2

Table 2308.9.6.  In the 3rd line of the table heading delete “header” following “Maximum.”  Note to read: “(Maximum
spans for douglas...”

Change the span ratings and number of required NJ for listings at “4-2x8" headers as follows:  

TABLE 2308.9.6
HEADER AND GIRDER SPANSa FOR INTERIOR-BEARING WALLS

(Maximum spans for Douglas Fir-Larch, Hem-Fir, Southern Pine, and Spruce-Pine-Firb and required number of jack studs)

HEADERS AND GIRDERS
SUPPORTING SIZE

BUILDING WIDTHc (feet)

20 28 36

Span NJd Span NJd Span NJd

One Floor Only 4-2×8 9-0 1 7-8 1 6-9 1

Two Floors 4-2×8 6-1 1 5-3 2 4-8 2



Page 6 of  24

Section 2409.4.  In the last paragraph remove the comma following “c2" and “Fa”

Section 2902.1.  Add new section 2902.1.1 to read as follows:
2902.1.1 Unisex toilet and bath fixtures.  Fixtures located within unisex toilet bathing rooms complying with
Section 404 of the International Plumbing Code are permitted to be included in determining the minimum
required number of fixtures for assembly and mercantile occupancies.

Chapter 35 Reference Standards

NFPA
NFPA 285-98 - Change the word “International” to “Intermediate.”

Table E104.2.  In the 1st column, last row, change “Over 1,001" to “1,001 and over.”

Second Printing, June 2001

Table 302.3.3.  Revise the entry at “A-3/M” from “22" to “2".

Table 307.7(1).  Revise “Loose baled” in the Combustible Fiber row, Class column to be such that “Loose” is placed
above “baled”, forming two rows.

Section 406.3.11.  Change section reference from “406.2.8" to “406.3.8”

Section 412.3.  Change referenced section “412.3.5" to “412.3.6"

Table 503. Revise “Group M / Type V B” entry from “1,900" to “9,000.”

Table 704.8.  Revise heading of columns to read as follows:
“Greater than 3 to 5b”  (i.e. remove footnote f reference)
“Greater than 5 to 10d,f ” (i.e. remove footnote b reference)
“Greater than 10 to 15c,d,f ” (i.e. remove footnote b reference)

Section 707.2. Exception 4.  Change referenced section from “Section 711.4.4" to “Section 711.4"

Section 909.8.5. (Equation 9-7).  In the explanation of variables, revise as follows:
“Tc = Plum centerline.......
      = 0.60(Ta + 460) Qc

2/3z -5/3 + Ta”
and
“For SI:     Tc = 0.08Ta Qc

2/3z-5/3 + Ta”

Table 1004.3.2.1.  For occupancy R, revise the second column to read “Greater than 10"

Section 1005.3.6.5.  Add the following text at the end of Exception 4: “....corridors, provided that items 4.1 through
4.4 are met:”

Table 1604.5, under Category III, 6th bulleted item revise to read as follows:
“.....where the quantity of material exceeds the maximum allowable quantity of Table 307.7(2).”

Section 2113.7.  Revise the referenced section from “2113.2" to “2113.5"

Section 2304.10.2.  Replace “immediate” with “intermediate”



Page 7 of  24

Section 2306.4.3.  Revise line 13 to read: “...spaced 24 inches (610 mm) on center, nails shall be spaced 6 inches
(152 mm) on center along intermediate...”

Table 2308.10.9. note a: Revise to read as follows: “Spans are based on simple beam action with 10 pounds per
square foot dead load and provisions for a 300-pound concentrated load on a 12-inch width of decking.  Random lay
up.............of Section 2308.10.9. Lumber.....”

Section 2511.1.1.  Revise referenced section “2508" to “2507".

*Table 3409.6.3.   In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, S-1
and S-2.

*Table 3409.6.4.  In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, S-1
and S-2.

*Table 3409.6.6(2).  Change TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION column heads to Roman numerals (IA, IB, IIA, IIB, IIIA, IIIB,
IV, VA and VB)

*Section 3409.6.7.1.  Category e, 3rd line, delete the +.

*Table 3409.6.8.  In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, S-1
and S-2.

*Table 3409.6.9.  In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-2, A-3 and A-4.

*Table 3409.6.10. In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4.

Section 3409.6.11.1.  Insert new Item 1 as follows:
1.  Category a — Compliance with the minimum required means of egress capacity or number of exits is
achieved through the use of a fire escape in accordance with Section 3403.

Renumber existing “Items 1 through 4" to be “Items 2 through 5.”

Table 3409.6.11.  In the heading for Category a, add a superscript a (aa).

*Table 3409.6.11. In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4.

*Table 3409.6.12.  In the OCCUPANCY column, add a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4.

*Section 3409.6.13.  Change section title to read: “Maximum exit access travel distance”.

*Table 3409.6.16. In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-4.

*Section 3409.6.17.  Change section title to read: “Automatic sprinklers.”

*Table 3409.6.17. In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, S-1
and S-2.

*Table 3409.8.  In the OCCUPANCY column, insert a hyphen in occupancy designations A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, S-1 and
S-2.

*Table 3409.7.  Change title of Safety Parameter 3409.6.18 to read: “Incidental Use” (delete Area Protection).

Appendix H, Section H108.1., third sentence, replace “...full deal weight...” with “...full dead weight...”

Appendix H, Section H115., Replace word “Plasters” with “Plastics” in the title of ASTM D635.



Page 8 of  24

Index, under “DEAD END” Revise reference to be “1004.3.2.3"

First Printing, March 2000

Back of Title Page.  Make the following changes:
In first paragraph, last line, change Suite 708 to Suite 1600.
Add Web site address for Building Officials and Code Administrators International, Inc.

www.bocai.org
Add Web site address for International Conference of Building Officials

www.icbo.org
Add Web site address for Southern Building Codes Congress International, Inc.

www.sbcci.org

Page iv.  First paragraph under Maintenance, remove indention in line 1.

Page v SAMPLE ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE.
Delete the following lines:

Section 103.6. Insert: [APPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]
Section 303.1.4. Insert: [DATES IN TWO LOCATIONS]
Section 602.3. Insert: [DATES IN TWO LOCATIONS]
Section 602.4. Insert: [DATES IN TWO LOCATIONS]

Table of Contents.
Revise the Table of Contents for Appendix I Patio Covers as follows:

APPENDIX I PATIO COVERS.................................729
Section
I101 General........................................................729
I102 Definitions....................................................729
I103 Exterior Openings........................................729
I104 Structural Provisions....................................729

Section 101.2.  In line 1 of the first paragraph, change “the International Building Code” to “this code.”

Section 101.4.4.  In line 2 delete “s” from “alterations and repairs.”

Section 101.4.5.  In line 5, delete the comma after “safety.”

Section 104.6.  In the 11th line, change “be” to “is.”  

Section 104.8.  In lines 1 and 2, lower case “board of appeals.”

Section 105.2.  Under the heading Mechanical on page 4, Item 7, add an “s” to pound in line 2.

Section 106.1, Exception.  In line 5, change “reviewing” to “review.”

Section 106.1.3. Paragraph 2, lines 1 and 2.  Change “manufacturing” to “manufacturer’s.”

Section 106.3.4.2.  In paragraph 2, line 9, change “their” to “the.”

Section 109.3.5, Exception.  Change “fire-resistive” to “fire-resistance-rated.”



Page 9 of  24

Section 110.3.  In the 5th line, change “that shall contain” to “that contains.”

Section 201.4.  In the 2nd line, change “chapter” to “section.”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the definition of [F] AEROSOL, Level 2, add an “s” to “product.”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the definition of ALTERNATING TREAD DEVICE, change “1002" to “1002.1.”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the definition of CLADDING, place quotation marks around Components and Cladding
so that it reads:  “Components and Cladding.”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the term [F] COMBUSTIBLE DUSTS, delete the “s”.

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the definition of [F] COMBUSTIBLE LIQUID, close III A and III B to read:  IIIA and
IIIB.

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  Delete the definition for DWELLING UNIT and replace it with:  “See Section 310.2"

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  Delete the definition and cross reference for: [F] FLAMMABLE.  See Section 307.2.

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  HISTORIC BUILDINGS, change the referenced section from “3405" to “3406.”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  Delete the entry for SALLYPORT.

Section 202 DEFINITIONS.  In the definition for SKYLIGHTS AND SLOPED GLAZING, add (0.26 rad) so that the
line reads:  “...of 15 degrees (0.26 rad) or more...”

Section 202 DEFINITIONS. In the term SPECIFIED COMPRESSIVE STRENGTH OF MASONRY (fNm), make the
m a subscript.  The term should read:  fNm.

Section 302.1, item 8.  Revise as follows: “Groups R-1, R-2, R-3 as applicable...”

Table 302.1.1.  Under the column “Room or Area,” revise the 6th entry to read:  “...classified as Group H, located...”
and revise the 11th entry to add an “s” on “room.”

Section 302.2.  In the 2nd line, add a comma after “302.3.1.”

Section 302.3.3 Separated uses.  In the second line of Exception 2, revise to read:
“...residence and its attic area by means of minimum...”

Table 302.3.3.  Revise footnote b1 to read:  “...floor area; ” and footnote b2:  to read “...square feet; or...”

Section 307.2 Definitions.  In the definition of BOILING POINT, in the 7th line, add a hyphen between “20" and
“percent” so that it reads “20-percent.”

Section 307.2 Definitions.  In the term COMBUSTIBLE DUSTS, delete the “s”.

Section 307.2 Definitions.  In the definition of COMBUSTIBLE LIQUID, close III A and III B to read:  IIIA and IIIB.

Section 307.2 Definitions.  In the definition of UN/DOTn Class 1 explosives, Division 1.4, in the first line, change
“present” to “pose.”

Section 307.5 Group H-3 structures.  Delete “Aerosols, Level 2 and Level 3" from the list of materials.

[F] Table 307.7(1).  Revise the quantity for oxidizers in the 1st row under “Use-Open Systems, Liquid” to read:
“(1/4)g”



Page 10 of  24

[F] Table 307.7(1).  Revise the class for organic peroxide in the 1st row to read:  “UD”

[F] Table 307.7(1).  Revise Class 4 for oxidizer, solid pounds, to read:  “1e,g”

[F] Table 307.7(1).  Revise the material “Combination (1A, 1B, 1C)” to read:
Combination Flammable Liquid (1A, 1B, 1C)

[F] Table 307.7(1).  In the row “Unstable(reactive)”, Maximum Allowable Quantity revise entries as follows:
Class 3  H-1 or H-2
Class 2  H-3
Class 1  blank

[F] Table 307.7(1).  Revise Note ‘b” as follows: 
“The aggregate quantity in use and storage shall not exceed the quantity listed for storage.”

[F] Table 307.7(2).  Revise Notes “e “ and “ f “ as follows:
Note e, second line:  “Where Note f also .................”
Note f, second line:  “Where Note e also .................”

[F] Table 307.7(2).  Revise the quantity for highly toxic under “Use-Open Systems, Liquid to read: “(3)i”

[F] Section 307.9, Exception 12.  Delete “irritants and sensitizers” in the first line.

Section 402.7.1.  Revise line 4 to read:  “...con sidered as separate buildings where...”

Section 402.14.2.  In the 4th line add (914 mm) following “35 inches.”

Section 403.5.  Revise to read: “...in accordance with 907.2.12.1.”

Section 404.1.1.  In the 1st line add “word and” so that it reads:  “The following word and term...”

Section 408.6 Exception.  Correct the metric conversion in the second line of Item 3 to read: “15 240 mm.”

Section 410.3 Stages.  Change section reference from “410.3.9" to “410.3.7.”

Section 410.4.  Revise the last four lines of this section to read: “Where the space beneath the permanent platform
is used only for equipment, wiring or plumbing, the underside of the permanent platform need not be
protected.”

Section 411.7.  Revise the first sentence to read: “Exit signs shall be installed at the required exit or exit access
doorways of amusement buildings.”

Section 412.3.1.  Revise the first line to read:   “The following word and term shall, for...”

Section [F] 412.3.4 Smoke Detection.  Change section reference from “907.2.22" to “907.2.21.”

Section 414.2.4 Hazardous material in Group M display and storage areas and in Group S storage areas.
Change table references in the 8 th line from “Tables 307.2(1) and 307.2(2)” to “Tables 307.7(1) and
307.7(2).”

Section 415.2 Definitions.  In the 3rd line of the definition of HPM ROOM, delete the word “Use.”

Table 415.3.2.  In the “Material” column, change “detonatable” to “detonable” in two places.

Table 415.3.2.  Revise the class for oxidizers, liquids, and solids in the second row from “4" to “2.”



Page 11 of  24

Table 415.3.2.  In the SI conversion factors, delete the conversion factors for 1 foot and 1 square foot.
Add conversion factors as follows:
1 ton = 906 kg, 1 cubic foot = 0.02832 m3.

Table 415.9.2.1.1.  In the column heads “Solids” and “Liquids,” add the word “per” to the units of measure to read:
“pounds per square foot” and “gallons per square foot.”

Table 415.9.5.9.  In the SI conversion factors, delete the factor for 1 square foot.

Section 416.2.  Revise lines 1 and 2 to read:
 “Spray rooms shall be enclosed with fire barrier walls and horizontal assemblies or both with ...”

Table 503.  Group H-4, Type I/A/UL, change “A” to read: “UL,” not “IL.”

Section 506.2.  In the definitions of terms for Equation 5-2, add the unit “(feet)” to the definitions of P and W.”

Section 507.5.  Revise the 3rd line to read as follows:
“...ing occupancies in Groups F and S, in accordance with...”

Section 508.2 Group S-2 enclosed parking garage with Group A, B, M or R above. Revise the 2nd line to read:
“...B, M, or R above.  A basement and/or first story above grade plane...”

Revise the 1st line of Item 1 to read:  “1.  The basement and/or first story above grade plane is of Type...”

Revise the second line of Item 2 to read:  “...minimum 3-hour fire-resistance rating contains only...”

Revise the third and fourth lines of Item 2 to read:
“Group A having an assembly room with an occupant load of less than 300, or Group B, M or R ; and...”

Revise Item 3, Exception 2 to read: “...Group A having an assembly...less than 300, and Group B and M shall
be...”

Section 508.3 Group S-2 enclosed parking garage with Group S-2 open parking garage above.  Change the
table reference in Item 3 from “Table 406.3.1" to “Table 406.3.5.”

Section 508.8.1.  In line 9, change “fire-resistive” to “fire-resistance-rated” and delete the word “use.”

Section 603.1.  In Items 8 and 19, change “fire-resistive” to “fire-resistance-rated.”
 
Section 702.1. In the definition of Fire Separation Distance, add a comma as follows:

“...closest interior lot line, to the centerline...”

Section 707.  Revise section title as follows:  “SHAFT ENCLOSURES”

Section 708.4.  In line 2, change “floor/roof” to read: “floor or roof”

Section 714.3.  In the last line of this section, change Section 714.3.6 to Section 714.3.7.
 
Section 714.3.2.  Second line of paragraph, change metric equivalent for 0.125 inch to “3.2 mm.”

Section 714.3.7.  Revise last sentence to read: “...in accordance with Sections 704.8, 704.9, or 704.10...
.”

Section 715.6.3.  4th line, revise to read: “...nonfire-resistance-rated floor assemblies and that connect... .” 

Make the same change in the 12th line of that paragraph.



Page 12 of  24

R
h W D

=






130
2

0 75( '/ ) .

Table 719.1(1). In Item 1-3.3, under the column headed “Insulating Material Used,” the word “fill1" should read: “filll"

Table 719.1(1).  Under the column for insulating material, in the subcolumn headed “2 hour,” two entries for Row 4,
Item 4-1.1, must be revised.  The entry for 8" wide beams is 21/2

b.  Remove the reference to note b.  Also,
change the entry for beams over 12" wide from “—“ to “2".

Tables 719.1(1), 719.1(2), and 719.1(3).  Correct SI conversion to read:  “1 cubic foot = 0.0283 m3.”

Table 719.1(2).  Change the entry for Item 5-1.2 in the “3 hour” column to 63/4.

Table 719.1(3).  Change the entry for Item 18-1.1 under the “3 hour” column to 21/4
p.

Table 720.5.1(2).  In the row for Specific Heat, change “Bth” to “Btu” in two places.

Table 720.5.1(5).  Revise table title by deleting the phrase “Tube Shapes.”

On page 162, for nominal tube size of 4x4x1/2, concrete masonry density of 80 pcf, and 3-hour fire
resistance, change Te value from “271" to “2.71.”

On page 162, revise the title of the 7th column to read:  “Nominal pipe size (inches)”

Section 720.3.1.1.  Revise the 7th line by changing section reference from “720.3.1" to “720.3.2.”
 
Table 720.5.1(6).  Under Column Size change “Wx12x50" to “W12x50.”

Change “Square structural tubing” to “Steel tubing.”

Section 720.5.1.2 Gypsum wallboard protection.  Revise Equation 7-12 to appear as follows:

Table 720.6.2(3).  In the table title change the superscript “1" (MEMBRANE1) to a superscript “a” (MEMBRANEa).

Section 720.7 Other reference documents.  Change section reference from “703.3(1)” to “703.3 Item 1.”

Section 903.2.9 Group R-4.  Revise the 3rd line of the Exception to read as follows:
“...shall be allowed in Group R-4 facilities.”

Section 907.2.1 Group A.  Revise the 5 th line to read:  “...shall be provided with a fire alarm system as required for
the...”

Section 907.2.13.2 Atriums connecting more than two stories.  Revise the 3rd line to read as follows:
“...-cies with an atrium that connects more than two stories.”

Section 907.2.23 Battery rooms.  Revise the fourth line to read:
“...of more than 50 gallons (189.3 L).  The detection system...”

Section 908.3.2.  Relocate the Exception paragraph to follow Item 3 just above Section 908.4.  

Revise the paragraph immediately below the current location of the Exception  to read:
 “908.3.3 Valve Closure.  The automatic closure of...”



Page 13 of  24

Section 1003.3.3.1 Stairway width.  Change section reference in 2nd line from “1003.2.3.1" to “1003.2.3.”

Section 1003.3.3.9 Spiral stairways.  Delete the Exception to Section 1003.3.3.9.

Section 1109.1 Signs.  Change section reference in Item 3 from “1103.2.13.5" to “1003.2.13.5.”

Section 1202.4 Natural Ventilation.  Add the following to the end of the paragraph:
“The operating mechanism for such openings shall be provided with ready access so that the openings are
readily controllable by the building occupants.”

Section 1203.1 Equipment and systems.  Revise the 2nd line to read:
“...for human occupancy shall be provided with active or passive space-heating...”

Section 1507.3.3 Underlayment.  Revise the 3rd line to read:
“Type II; ASTM D 2626 or ASTM D 249 Type I mineral-...”

Section 1507.3.5, Item 1.  Change section reference from “5.3" to “6.3.”

Section 1605.1.  In line 5 change “1620.1.7" to ”1620.1.6, 1620.1.9" and in line 6 change “1620.3.5" to “1620.3.4.”

Section 1607.1 General.  Change section reference from “1602.2" to “1602.1.”

Table 1607.1, Item 27.  Revise the entry for “Uninhabitable attics without storage” to remove the number “10" from
the Occupancy or Use column and relocating it under the Uniform column.

Table 1607.1, footnote b. Change “density of 65 pounds per square foot” to “density of 65 pounds per cubic foot.”

Section 1607.9.2.  In 2nd line, change “1607.9" to “1607.9.1.”

Section 1609.1.1, Exception 4. Revise to read “Designs using NAAMM FP 1001, Guide Specifications for Design
of Metal Flagpoles.”

Table 1609.6.2.1(1).  Revise the rows with basic wind speeds 130 mph through 170 mph by changing “Longitudnal”
to read:  “Longitudinal.”

Table 1609.6.2.1(1). Revise entry in second row, under column Horizontal Loads, End Zone, Roof from “- 9/8" to
“- 9.8.”

Section 1612.2 Definitions.  For the definition of Flood Hazard Area Subject to High Velocity Wave Action,
revise the 5th line to read:  “...VO, VE, or V1-30.”

Section 1612.5 Flood hazard certificates.  In Item 1.1, change section reference from “106.3.3" to “109.3.3.”

In Item 2.1, change section reference from “106.3.3" to “109.3.3.”

Section 1615.1.1 Site class definitions.  Revise the 7th line to read:
“...1615.1.5.  Where site-specific data are not available to a...”

Section 1616.2.3 Seismic Use Group III.  Revise the second line by deleting the phrase 
“the failure of which would result in.”

Section 1617.2.2 Seismic Design Category D, E, or F.  In the second paragraph, replace the letter “r” with the
letter “?.”

Table 1617.3.  Replace “?A” with “? a” and replace “hSX” with “hsx.”



Page 14 of  24

Section 1617.4.1.1 Calculation of seismic response coefficient.  Revise Equation 16-37 to read:
“Cs = 0.044SDSIE”

Revise the variable descriptions for Equation 16-38 to read:
SD1 = The design spectral response acceleration at 1-second period as determined from Section 1615.1.3.
S1 = The maximum considered earthquake spectral response acceleration at 1-second period determined

in accordance with Section 1615.1.

Section 1617.4.2.1 Approximate fundamental period.  Revise Equation 16-39 to read:    “Ta = CThn
3/4"

Add Equation 16-40 to read:  “Ta = 0.1N”

Section 1617.4.4 Horizontal shear distribution.  Revise Equation 16-43 to read:

V Fx i
i x

n

=
=
∑

Section 1617.4.6.1 Story drift determination.  Revise the 3rd line of the 4th paragraph to read:
“...P-delta effects, ad, 1.0/(1-?) as determined in Section...”

Section 1617.4.6.2 P-delta effects.  Revise the variable description of hsx (follows Eq 16-47) by changing the
required dimensions from “(feet or m)” to “(inches or mm).”

Table 1617.6.  Revise Item E under Category 6, Inverted Pendulum Systems to appear as a separate category
as follows:
“7. Structural steel systems not specifically detailed for seismic resistance”

Section 1618.10.3.1 Nonlinear time history.  In the 7th line, revise “R/I” to read “R/IE.”

Section 1619.1 Analysis procedure.  Change the section reference of ASCE 7 from “9.2.5" to “9.5.5.”

Section 1620.2.  Revise 4th line as follows:  “Category B and to Sections 1620.2.1 through 1620.2.2.”

Section 1620.3.  Revise 4th line as follows:  “...to Sections 1620.3.1 through 1620.3.6.”

Section 1620.4.  Revise as follows:  “1620.4 Seismic Category E or F.  Structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category E or F (Section 1616)...for Seismic Design Category D and to Section 1620.4.1.”

Section 1621.1.7 Component anchorage.  Revise item 2.2 to read:  “1.3 times the force in the connected part due
to the prescribed forces.”

Table 1621.2.  Revise the headings on the two right hand columns as follows:
Component Amplification Factor (ap)a

Component Response Modification Factor (Rp)

Section 1621.3.   Revise last sentence to read:  “...shall meet the requirements of Sections 1621.3.1 through
1621.3.14.4.”

Table 1621.3.  Revise the headings row by adding a superscript “a” to ap.

Revise heads on two right hand columns as follows:
Component Amplification Factor (ap)a

Component Response Modification Factor (Rp)

Add footnote “a” as follows:
“a. Where justified by detailed dynamic analyses, a lower value of ap is permitted, but shall not be less than



Page 15 of  24

1.  The reduced value of ap shall be between 2.5, assigned to flexible or flexibly attached equipment, and 1,
assigned to rigid or rigidly attached equipment.”

Section 1621.2.7 Partitions.  In the Exception, change section reference from “1622.3.4" to “1607.13.”

Section 1622.2.5 Minimum seismic forces.  In Item 6, change section reference from “1616" to “1618.5.”

Section 1622.2.5 Minimum seismic forces.  In Exception 1, change section reference from “1617.4" to “1618.”

Section 1622.2.5 Minimum seismic forces.  In Exception 3, change section reference from “1618" to “1619.”

Table 1622.2.5(1).  Add column heads as follows:
Response Modification Coefficient, R
System Over-Strength Factor, O0

Deflection Amplification Factor, Cd

Section 1622.3.4.1.  In the last line, change Ap to ap.

Section 1622.3.4.3.  Change section reference in 3rd line from “1617.5.2" to “1617.4.3.”

Section 1623.2.2.1 Design Displacement.  Revise the variable description for BD to read:
“BD = Numerical coefficient related to the effective damping of the isolation system at the design

displacement, ßD, as set forth in Table 1623.2.2.1.

Table 1623.2.2.1.  Revise the title of the left column to read:
“EFFECTIVE DAMPING, ßD or ßM   
(PERCENTAGE OF CRITICAL)”

Section 1623.2.3 Maximum lateral displacement.  Revise variable description of BM by changing “ßD” to “ßM.”

Section 1623.2.5.  Revise last line to read:   “...dance with Sections 1623.2.5.1 through 1623.2.5.3.”

Section 1623.3.1.  In the 3rd paragraph, revise 4th and 5th lines as follows:
 “DDN is permitted to be used in lieu of DTD and DMN is permitted to be used in lieu of DTM where...”

Section 1623.3.1. Correct term in equation 16-88 from “DDN" to “DDN“
    Correct term in equation 16-89 from “DMN” to “DMN“

Section 1623.3.3.  Revise last line to read:  “‘...by Sections 1623.3.3.1 through 1623.3.3.2.”

Section 1623.3.6.  Revise last line to read:   “...determined by Sections 1623.3.6.1 through 1623.3.6.4.”

Section 1623.4.1.  Revise as follows:   “...displacements in accordance with Sections 1623.4.1.1 through
1623.4.1.3.”

Section 1623.5.2.  Revise last line to read: “...meet the requirements in Sections 1623.5.2.1 through 1623.5.2.3.”

Table 1704.5.1.  Revise Inspection Task 2c and d to appear as follows:



Page 16 of  24

TABLE 1704.5.1
LEVEL 1 SPECIAL INSPECTION

INSPECTION TASK

FREQUENCY OF INSPECTION REFERENCE FOR CRITERIA

Continuous
during task

listed

Periodically
during task

listed
IBC section ACI 530/ ASCE

5/ TMS 402a

ACI 530.1/
ASCE 6/ TMS

602a

2.  The inspection program shall verify:
     a.  Size and location of structural elements

     b.  Type, size and location of anchors, including
           other details of anchorage of masonry to
           structural members, frames or other construction

     c.  Specified size, grade and type of reinforcement

     d.  Welding of reinforcing bars

     e.  Protection of masonry during cold weather
          (temperature below 40EF) or hot weather
          (temperature above 90EF)

X

X

X

X

X

Sec. 2108.9.2.11
Item 2

Sec. 2104.3,
2104.4

Sec. 1.15.4,
2.1.2

Sec. 1.12

Sec. 2.1.8.6,
2.1.8.6.2

3.3G

Art. 2.4, 3.4

Art. 1.8

Table 1704.5.3.  Revise Inspection Tasks 1 and 2 to appear as follows:

TABLE 1704.5.3
LEVEL 2 INSPECTION

INSPECTION TASK

FREQUENCY OF INSPECTION REFERENCE FOR CRITERIA

Continuous
during task

listed

Periodically
during task

listed
IBC section ACI 530/ ASCE

5/ TMS 402a

ACI 530.1/
ASCE 6/ TMS

602a

1. From the beginning of masonry construction, the
following shall be verified to ensure compliance:

a. Proportions of site-mixed mortar and grout. X Art. 2.6A

b. Placement of masonry units and construction of
mortar joints.

X _ Art. 3.3B

c. Placement of reinforcement and connectors. X Sec. 1.12.3 Art. 3.4

d. Grout space prior to grouting. X Art. 3.2D

e. Placement of grout. X Art. 3.5

2. The inspection program shall verify:

a. Size and location of structural elements. X Art. 3.3G

b. Type, size and location of anchors, including other
details of anchorage of masonry to structural
members, frames or other construction.

X Sec. 1.15.4,
2.1.2

c. Specified size, grade and type of reinforcement. X Sec. 1.12 Art. 2.4, 3.4

d. Welding of reinforcing bars. X Sec. 2108.9.2.11
Item 2

Sec. 2.1.8.6,
2.1.8.6.2

e. Protection of masonry during cold weather
(temperature below 40EF) or hot weather
(temperature above 90EF).

X Sec. 2104.3,
2104.4

Art. 1.8

3. Preparation of any required grout specimens, mortar
specimens and/or prisms shall be observed.

X - Sec. 2105.3,
2105.4, 2105.5

- Art. 1.4

4. Compliance with required inspection provisions of the
construction documents and the approved submittals
shall be verified.

- X - - Art. 1.5



Page 17 of  24

N
N

V
V

u

n

u

nφ φ
+ ≤12.

Section 1714.5.1. Correct all three standard references to read, “AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2.”

Table 1805.5(1).  Under Plain Masonry, for a wall height of 8 feet, unbalanced backfill height of 8 feet, and soil lateral
load of 30 psf, change “10(solidb)” to “10(solidc).”

Section 1807.2.23.1. Revise 4th and 5th lines of exception to read, “... and patios, of Group R-3 and Group U,
occupancies ...”

*Section 1906.1.6.  Change section title to read: “Forms for prestressed concrete.”

*Section 1913.5.4.1.  Delete hyphen from section title and from the term “single headed” in first line.  Delete hyphen
from “single headed” in first line of second paragraph.

Section 1913.5.4.2.  Change section title to read: “Group of headed anchors”.

Section 1913.5.4.2.  In the first sentence change: “For multiple-headed anchors...” to “For groups of headed
anchors...”
Section 1913.7 Interaction of tensile and shear forces.  Revise Equation 19-34 to read:

Section 2103.9.2 Electrically conductive dry-set mortars.  Change reference in last sentence from
“ANSI A 108.5" to “ANSI A 108.7.”

Section 2107.2.3 ACI 530/ASCE 5/TMS 420, Section 2.1.8.6.1.1, lap splices.

In the section title change “TMS 420" to “TMS 402.”

Change “ld” to “lld” (4 places).

Revise description of “lld” to read:
“lld = Minimum lap splice length, inches (mm).”

Delete description “f  = Strength reduction factor, f  = 0.8.”

Section 2108.6 Headed and bent-bar anchor bolts.  Revise 4th line to read:  “...are permitted to be placed...”

Section 2108.6.1.  Revise last three lines of this paragraph to read:  “...in masonry shall be the lesser of the value
given by Equation 21-8 (strength governed by masonry breakout) or Equation 21-9 (strength governed by steel).”

Section 2108.6.2 Axial strength of bent-bar anchor bolts.  Revise Equation 21-13 to read:

Ba = f (1.5f’medb + 300p(lb + e + db)db)

Section 2108.6.2.1 Projected area of masonry.  Change “(Equation 21.14)” to “(Equation 21-14).”

Section 2108.9.2.10 Development.  Under Item 1, revise the description of “K” to read:
“K = The lesser of the masonry cover or clear spacing between adjacent reinforcement, inches (mm).

Section 2108.9.2.11 Splices.  In Item 1 and Equation 21-25, change “ld” to “lld.”  Revise description of “lld” to read:
“lld = Minimum lap splice length, inches (mm).”

Section 2108.9.2.13.1 Method A.  Change “hsx” to “hsx.”



Page 18 of  24

Section 2108.10.4.1. Change Item 1 to read, “  An, pounds (for SI:  An, where fN is in MPa and15. ′f m 0 125. ′f m

An is in mm2).”

Section 2110.1.1 Limitations.  Revise the second line of Exception 1 to read:
“...rating of not less than 3/4 hour shall be permitted...”

In Exception 2, change section reference from “Exception 3" to “Exception 1.2.”

Figure 2110.3.1. Replace figure with the following:

  

Table 2113.16(2).  Revise title of left column to read:  “FLUE SIZE, INSIDE DIMENSION”

Section 2211.3.3 Attachment.  In the second line after the word “minimum” insert:
“No. 8 flat-head self-drilling tapping screws”

Table 2304.7(3).  In the section of the table headed SINGLE FLOOR GRADES, in the Panel Thickness column, 3rd

row, change “34" to “¾.”

Section 2305.3.2 Deflection.  Relocate Equation 23-2 to follow the second paragraph.

Table 2305.3.7.2.  Revise the maximum opening height for H/2 and a 10' wall height from “5'0"” to “5'-0".”

Revise the wall height column to read: “WALL HEIGHT, H.”

Delete “H = “ from footnote a.

Section 2306.1 Allowable stress design.  In the standards listed for APA—The Engineered Wood Association,
make the following changes.

Plywood Design Specification Supplement 2 - Design & Fabrication of Glued Plywood—Lumber Beams



Page 19 of  24

EWS S475     Glued Laminated Beam Design Tables
EWS X450     Glulam in Residential Construction
EWS X440     Product and Application Guide: Glulam

Table 2306.3.1.  The diagrams for Case 5 and Case 6 following the table have been reversed.  The diagram labeled
Case 5 is actually Case 6 and the diagram labeled Case 6 is actually Case 5.

Table 2306.4.5.  In the column headed Fastener Spacing, in block 4, Unblocked, “8/2h” should read: “8/12h”

Section 2308.8.7.  Change referenced section from “1202.4" to “1202.3.”

Table 2308.9.3(1).  For Seismic Category C, under the column headed Condition, change second line to read: “...or
second of three story”

Revise note c to read:  “...for alternative braced...”

Section 2308.10.8.  Change section referenced in the last line from “2304.6.2" to “2304.7.2.”

Table 2308.10.9.  In both pages of this table add text to the two right hand column heads as follows:
Bending Stress, f
Modulus of Elasticity, E

Section 2308.11.3.2, Item 2.  In line 11, change “4.8 inches (122 mm)” to “48 inches (1219 mm).”

Figure 2308.11.3.2.   Revise note to read:  “Where footing section “A” is less than 8'-0" long...”

Section 2308.12 Additional requirements for conventional construction in Seismic Design Category D or E.
In the 4th line, change section reference from “2308.12.7" to “2308.12.9.”

Section 2308.12.4 Braced wall line sheathing.  In next to last line of the first paragraph, delete the words “2-by.”

Section 2308.12.6 Irregular structures.  Revise the Exception to Item 2 to read as follows:
“Exception: Portions of roofs or floors that do not support braced wall panels above are permitted to extend
up to 6 feet (1829 mm) beyond a braced wall line.  See Figure 2308.12.6(4).”

Section 2406.2 Hazardous locations.  Under Item 6, delete the word “Use” and the letter “K” after Exception 2.
Align Item 10 with Item 9.

Section 2502 Definitions.  For the definition of WIRE BACKING, in the 3rd line change the word “providing” to
“provide.”

Section 2509.1 Wet areas.  Change references from “1210.2 and 1210.3" to “1209.2 and 1209.3" respectively.

Section 2606.4 Specifications.  In the 7th line revise “ASTM E84" to read “ASTM E 84.”

Table 2607.4.  In the FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE column, second row, change “1" to “11.”

*Section 2610.1.  At the beginning of the 3rd line of this section, delete “ting.”

Section 2610.2 Mounting.  In Exceptions 1 and 2, change “unclassified roof covering” to “nonclassified roof
covering.”

Section 2702.2.12 Pyrophoric materials.  Revise the second line to read:
“...be provided for occupancies with silane gas in...”



Page 20 of  24

AA
SP OP area Table

=
+ + ×( ) ( , )100 503

100

*Section 2902.5.  In the 8th line, change “employe’s” to “employee’s”.

Section 3001.2 Referenced standards.  Revise standard reference from “ALI B153.1" to “ALI ALCTV.”

Section 3409.2.  Replace existing section with the following:
“Structures existing prior to [ DATE TO BE INSERTED BY THE JURISDICTION.  NOTE: IT IS
RECOMMENDED THAT THIS DATE COINCIDE WITH THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF BUILDING CODES
WITHIN THE JURISDICTION], in which there is work involving additions, alterations, or changes of
occupancy, shall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the provisions of Sections 3402
through 3406.”

Section 3409.6.1 Building height.  In the 9th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.1" to 3409.6.1"

Section 3409.6.2 Building area.  In the 10th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.2" to 3409.6.2.”

Section 3409.6.2.1 Allowable area formula.  Revise Equation 34-2 to read:

Delete the “Note...” at the end of Section 3409.6.2.1.

Section 3409.6.3 Compartmentation.  In the 10th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation
from “34-1.6.3" to “3409.6.3.”

Table 3409.6.3.  Add a superscript “a” following the Column head CATEGORIES.  For Occupancy A2, change the
entry in column a from “4" to “0".

Section 3409.6.4 Tenant and dwelling separations.  In the 7 th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter
designation from “34-1.6.4" to “3409.6.4.”

Section 3409.6.5 Corridor Walls.  In the 8th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.5" to “3409.6.5.”

Section 3409.6.6 Vertical openings.  In the 9th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation
from “34-1.6.6" to “3409.6.6.”

Section 3409.6.7 HVAC systems.  In the 5th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.7" to “3409.6.7.”

Section 3409.6.8 Automatic fire detection.  In the 7th line of this paragraph change the Safety Parameter
designation from “34-1.6.8" to “3409.6.8.”

Section 3409.6.9 Fire alarm systems.  In the 5th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation
from “34-1.6.9" to “3409.6.9.”

Section 3409.6.10 Smoke Control.  In the 6 th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.10" to “3409.6.10.”

Section 3409.6.11 Means of egress capacity and number.  In the 15th line of this paragraph, change the Safety
Parameter designation from “34-1.6.11" to “3409.6.11.”



Page 21 of  24

Section 3409.6.12 Dead ends.  In the 7th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from
“34-1.6.12" to “3409.6.12.”

Section 3409.6.13 Maximum travel distance to an exit.  In the 5th line of this paragraph, change the Safety
Parameter designation from “34-1.6.13" to “3409.6.13.”

Section 3409.6.14 Elevator Control.  In the 8th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation
from “34-1.6.14" to 3409.6.14.”

Section 3409.6.15 Means of egress emergency lighting.  In the 6th line of this paragraph, change the Safety
Parameter designation from “34-1.6.15" to “3409.6.15.”

Section 3409.6.16 Mixed occupancies.  In the 11th line of this paragraph, change the Table number from 34-1.6.16"
to “3409.6.16.”

Section 3409.6.16 Mixed occupancies.   In the 13th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter
designation from “34-1.6.16" to 3409.6.16.”

Section 3409.6.17 Sprinklers.  In the 7 th line of this paragraph, change the Safety Parameter designation from “34-
1.6.17" to “3409.6.17.”

Section 3409.6.18 Incidental use.  Revise the 6th line of this paragraph to read:  “...lowest score from Table
3409.6.18 for the building...”

Chapter 35 Referenced Standards

Revise the referenced section in the 3rd line of the introduction paragraph from “102.8" to “102.4.”

AAMA

Delete standard AAMA 1001–97.
Change standard reference number from “AAMA/NWWDA 10-97" to “AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2 - 97.”

AHA

AHA A135.4-95 - Revise standard title to read: “Basic Hardboard.”

AISC

AISC ASD (1989) - Revise standard title to read: “Specification for Structural Steel Buildings - Allowable
Stress Design and Plastic Design.”

*AISC LRFD (1999) - Revise title to read: ” Load and Resistance Factor Design Specification for Structural
Steel Buildings...”

AITC

Change standard reference number from “ANSI/AITC A 190.1-92" to “AITC A 190.1-92.”

ALI

ALI ALCTV-98 - Revise standard title to read: “Standard for Automotive Lifts - Safety Requirements for
Construction, Testing, and Validation.”



Page 22 of  24

ANSI

*Change address as follows: American National Standards Institute
25 West 43rd Street, Fourth Floor
New York, NY 10036

ASCE

ASCE 6-99 - Revise standard title to read: “Specifications for Masonry Structures.”

ASCE 8-90 - Revise standard title to read: “Standard Specifications for the Design of Cold-formed Stainless
Steel Structural Members.”

ASCE 24-98 - Revise standard title to read: “Flood Resistant Design and Construction.”

ASTM

ASTM A 366/A 366M-97 - Revise standard title by deleting “Cold-rolled.”

ASTM C 59-95 - Revise standard title to read: “Specification for Gypsum Casting and Molding Plaster.”

ASTM C 1002-98 - Revise standard title by replacing “Board” with “Panel Products.”

ASTM D 1929-96 - Revise standard title to read: “Standard Test Method for Ignition Properties of Plastics.”

Delete ASTM D 4067-96.

ASTM D 4945-96 - Revise standard title to read: “Test Method for High-Strain Dynamic Testing of Piles.”

ASTM E 331–93 - Correct title to read “...Water Penetration of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls, Doors...”

ASTM E 1996-99 - Revise standard title by deleting “Glazed.”

ASME

ASME B31.4-92 - Revise standard title to read: “Pipeline Transportation Systems for Liquid Hydrocarbons
and Other Liquids.”

ASME B31.8-95 - Delete “Piping” from standard title.

AWPA

Revise date of AWPA C20 to read AWPA C20-93.

In the Referenced Sections column at the far right of the page, delete “1805.4.6" and “2303.1.8.”

AWPA C23-94 - Revise standard title to read: “Poles Used in Building Construction-Preservative Treatment
by Pressure Processes.”

Revise date of AWPA C27 to read AWPA C27-93.

AWS

AWS D1.4-98 - Revise section reference to read: “2108.9.2.11 Item 2.”



Page 23 of  24

EWA

APA PDS-97 - Revise Supplement 2 to read: “Design and Fabrication of Glued Plywood-lumber Beams.”

EWS S475-99 - Revise standard title by deleting “Data File:”

EWS X445-97 - Revise standard title by changing “Glulams” to “Glulam.”

EWS X450-97 - Revise standard title by changing “Glulams” to “Glulam.”

GA

GA 216-96 - Change section reference from “2509.1.2" to “2509.2.”

HPVA

Change standard reference number from “ANSI/HPVA HP-1-94" to “HPVA HP-1-94.”

ICC

ICC A 117.1-98 - Delete the following section references: 1104.2.1, 1104.3.1, 1105.1, 1105.2, 1105.3,
1105.4, 1106.2, Table 1106.2, 1106.3, 1106.4, 1106.4.8, 1106.5, 1107.2, 1107.3, 1109.2.1, 1109.2.2.1,
1109.2.2.2, 1109.2.2.3, 1109.2.3, 1109.2.5, 1109.2.8, 1110.2, and 1110.4.

Revise the standard reference number and title for the ICC Electrical Code to read as follows:

EC-2000 ICC Electrical CodeTM - Administrative Provisions

Add new listing for the National Association of Architectural Metal Manufacturers as follows:

NAAMM National Association of Architectural Metal Manufacturers
8 South Michigan Avenue
Suite 1000
Chicago, IL 60603

Standard Referenced
reference In code
number                           Title                                                                                                 section number

NAAMM FP 1001-97      Guide Specifications for Design of Metal Flagpoles.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .1609.1.1
____________________________________________________________________________________

NFPA

Revise date of NFPA 12A to read: “NFPA 12A-97.”

NFPA 80-99 - Revise standard title to read: “Fire Doors and Fire Windows.”

Revise “NFPA 204M-98" to read “NFPA 204-98.”

Revise date of NFPA 654 to read “NFPA 654-97.”

Section G104.1 Required.  Revise the 2nd line to read:



Page 24 of  24

“...who intends to conduct any development in a flood hazard...”

Section G105.6 Considerations.  Revise the 3rd line of Item 7 to read:
“..program for that area;”

Revise the 1st line of Item 9 to read:
“The expected heights, velocity, duration, rate of rise...”

Section G301.2 Subdivision requirements.  Items 1 and 2, change “plans penetration” to “plats.”

Section G401.3 Sewer facilities.  Revise the 6th line to read:
“...waters into the facilities and discharge from the facilities into flood waters, or impairment of...”

Appendix E Supplementary Accessibility Requirements - Revise the section number scheme from “E11..” to
“E1..” throughout the appendix.

Section J102 Referenced Standards.  Revise address by changing “Offrice” to “Office.” 

INDEX

BOLTS
High Strength, Steel.  Change “1707.3.3" to “1704.3.3"

CORRIDOR PROTECTION, EXIT ACCESS, Construction, fire protection.  Change “Table 1004.3.3.1" to
“Table 1004.3.2.1.”

*GRANDSTANDS, REVIEWING STANDS AND BLEACHERS
Indent “Exit Signs”

*INSTITUTIONAL I-1
Change “Eemergency” to “Emergency.”

MORTAR, Compressive stresses, masonry.  Change “Table 2103.7B” to “Table 2103.7(2).”

Add “SOUND TRANSMISSION.......................1206"

Change the section entry for WINDOW, Operable from “1109.1" to “1108.13.1.”

* Indicates items that have editorial significance but do not impact the technical provisions of the code, and as such
will not be posted on the ICC website.




